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Benjamin Ruiz promoted to Chief of Police in  
Perth Amboy  *Photo by Paul W. Wang

Tom Ward Lights Candle at Perth Amboy 
9-11 Memorial *Photo by C. Maxwell

Woodbridge Twp. 9-11 Ceremony
*Photo by Carolyn Maxwell

Perth Amboy 9-11 Ceremony. Paying tribute 
to NY & NJ victims *Photo by Bob Ned

Positions Drawn

(L to R) Perth Amboy Mayoral Candidates: Frank Salado, Bob Mc-
Coy, Miguel Morales, Wilda Diaz, Sharon Hubberman, Missing is 
Billy Delgado           *photo by Paul W. Wang

PERTH AMBOY - Thurs-
day, September 13 at 3 p.m. 
was the last chance for any 
candidate who qualiied to be 
placed on the ballot to drop out 
if they so desired. None did. 
City Clerk Elaine Jasko told 
those assembled at the Coun-
cil Chambers  that the ballot 
box being used to  pull out the 
candidates names for positions 
was returned to the City yes-
terday (September 12, 2012).
  This is the same ballot box 
that was used when Tony 
Jones  name was pulled in a 
housing scheme that former 
Mayor Joe Vas was involved 
in. Jones was awarded a house 
that he was not eligible for. 
Jones (Vas’ former driver). 
Jones pleaded guilty in con-
nection with a scheme involv-
ing him and Vas to rig a public 
housing lottery.
   Jasko had seven index cards 
with the candidates names on 
them. Mayoral candidate and 

their runningmates were listed 
on the same card.
  One Council candidate, James 
F. Aleck had his name listed 
individually on an index card. 
Jasko invited the candidates or 
their representatives to look at 
the index cards placed on the 
railing in front of the Council 
Chambers. She cautioned ev-
eryone “Look, but please do 
not touch the cards.”
 She scolded one person who 
touched the card and that per-
son committed that infraction 
gently placed the card back in 
place with her elbow.
   After the examination Jasko 
folded each card in half and 
placed them in the infamous 
ballot box. Jasko also brought 
a chuckle to the crowd when 
she said, “I purposely wore 
short sleeves for this event.”
  She spun the box backwards, 
and forwards before pull-
ing each name. The names 
came out in this order: Pos 

#1 Miguel Morales, Pos #2 
Wilda Diaz and her ticket, Pos 
#3 Bob McCoy, Pos #4 Jim F. 
Aleck (Council), Pos #5 Frank 
Salado, Pos #6 Sharon Hub-
berman, Pos #7 Billy Delgado 
and ticket.
  Jasko will forward this infor-
mation to Middlesex County 
Clerk Elaine Flynn. Flynn will 
be the one assigning the letters 
and numbers to each candi-
date.

   The County Clerk will be 
having a special class for poll 
clerks to familiarize them-
selves with the ballots.
    Jasko stated, “This is the 
irst time in my many years 
as the City Clerk that we’ve 
had the General, Munici-
pal and School Board elec-
tions on the same day.” 

   Each candidate was given 
a ifty-three page election or-
dinance booklet for 2012 pre-

Perth Amboy City Clerk Elaine 
Jasko with Ballot Box 

*Photo by Paul W. Wang

Mixing It Up
Council Meeting 9/12/12

PERTH AMBOY - Local resi-
dent Ron Mascenik addressed 
the Council in regards to the 
Perth Amboy redevelopment 
agency minutes not appearing 
on the City website. He was 
concerned because all other 
Perth Amboy Municipal Board 
meetings were there. Council 
President Kenneth Balut said, 
“The server had been hacked 
on Monday.” 
  After Mascenik spoke, resi-
dent John Siberry addressed 
Councilman Joel Pabon in re-
gards to what Siberry referred 
to as a legal junkyard on Ke-
arny Avenue.  Siberry was 
referring to a resident, Maria 
Garcia who is the Chair of 
the Planning Board. He said, 
“There are many cars in that 
resident’s backyard,” and he 
believes that there has been an 
illegal business being conduct-
ed there for the past ive years.
  The reason that Siberry 
brought this to Pabon’s atten-
tion is because he lives about 
four houses down from the 
residence in question.
  Councilman Pabon said, “I 
personally don’t go into any-
body’s backyard. Her neigh-
bor’s are okay with her back-
yard.”
   Joel Pabon stated that the 
situation on Kearny Avenue 
was looked into by Code En-
forcement. 
   Maria Garcia has appeared at 
Council Meetings in the past 
to address this issue. She said 
that she was in compliance 
with the City ordinances.

   Local resident Stanley Siera-
kowski and Mayoral Candi-
date Billy Delgado also voiced 
their concerns about the situa-
tion. Stanley agreed with Sib-
bery about the amount of cars 
in Garcia’s backyard and Del-
gado said that there is a pos-
sibility that she is “skirting the 
law.”
   Fernando Gonzalez interject-
ed that, “It is illegal to create a 
parking space in front of your 
house such as parking on the 
sidewalk and we were not en-
forcing codes across the board. 
I was looking through our or-
dinances for anything pertain-
ing to junkyards and we have 
none. Residents are selectively 
being picked on when it comes 
to enforcing ordinances.” 
   Council President Balut said, 
“I’ve turned numerous photos 
and reports to Code Enforce-
ment and to Attorney General 
showing  properties with code 
violations. I’ve even taken the 
Attorney General in person to 
show him some of these prop-
erties.”
  Councilman Kenneth Gonza-
lez remembered when people 
have come before the Council 
to complain that the ines were 
too high for code violations.
   Another lengthy discussion 
occured when Tommy Hudan-
ish questioned the salaries of 
the Business Administrator 
and City Attorney. “Why are 
we paying such high salaries 
to people who are not City 

Continued on Page 2
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LAW OFFICES OF
Kenneth L. Gonzalez

& Associates
• Auto Accidents
• Fall-Down Cases
• Municipal Court Cases
• Trafic Tickets
• Residential Real Estate
• Divorces
• Family Law Matters
133 New Brunswick Ave., Ste. 203
Perth Amboy
(Located at The Five Corners, between Smith & State Sts.)

(732) 442-2500

IF IT’S LOCAL

IT’S HERE!

There is no smoking in the 

hall during Bingo Games.

Bingo is operated on a 

cash basis.  No checks or

credit/debit cards are ac-

cepted.  Our Bingo

proceeds support School 

and Parish Programs.

EVERY Wednesday & Friday Night From 7:30 p.m. to 9:15 p.m.
The Door is Open at 6:30 p.m.

Ukrainian Catholic Assumption School Auditorium, 
Meredith & Jacques Sts, Perth Amboy

(kitchen is also open during bingo)

We have a POWER BALL GAME!!!
That Often Reaches $500 a Night!!!!!

Bingo Ofice 
732-826-1546

NOW REGISTERING
PRE-K (4 YR OLD) KINDERGARTEN, GRADES 1 -8

Assumption
Catholic School

Meredith and Jacques Streets

Perth Amboy

Middle States Accredited

NOW REGISTERING FOR 2012 - 2013

732-826-8721
ACSSCHOOLOFFICE@GMAIL.COM

WWW.ASSUMPTIONCATHOLICSCHOOL.NET

LUDWIG’S PHARMACY

    475 Brace Ave., Perth Amboy
        Tel: 732-442-6442 • Fax: 732-442-5784
M-F 9:30am-6:30pm • Sat 9am-1pm • Sun Closed

FREE Rx Pickup & Delivery
WE ACCEPT ALL PLANS
Including Medicare Part “D”

Fernando Oliveira, Proprietor

Attn: Walgreens Customers: 

We Are Now Accepting Express Script Ins. Plans

Continued from Page 1

Rally for Miguel Morales - The Armory, 
 Perth Amboy, September 14, 2012

*Photos by Joe Bayona and Carolyn Maxwell

Ads Sell
Call Carolyn

732-896-4446

pared by the Police Depart-
ment. This booklet explained 
in detail the rules and regula-
tions that the candidates have 
to follow during their cam-
paign.
   Jasko also expressed grati-
tude to the Middlesex County 
Clerk, Elaine Flynn for all 
the help and guidance she has 
given her in preparing for this 
election. She said that Elaine 
Flynn is a Perth Amboy girl 
and wants to make sure that 
everything goes as smoothly 
as possible.
  In conclusion, Jasko said, “If 
any of the candidates have any 
questions or suggestions they 
can feel free to call me.”

Positions 

Drawn

residents. Council President 
Kenneth Balut said he has no 
problem defending Businesses 
Administrator Fehrenbach 
and said, “He is worth every 
cent. Fehrenbach has saved 
our town millions of dollars. 
The outsiders that did the City 
harm were people like Insur-
ance Broker Francis Gartland 
who stole more than two mil-
lion dollars from the City.”
  Hudanish stated that he could 
understand outsiders being 
hired in some cases, “But that 
is not always the best case.” He 
was referring to three B.A.’s 
that were hired in a short time 
frame. Greg Fehrenach who 
was then replaced by Jane Fei-
genbaum, Assemblyman Craig 
Coughlin and then Fehrenbach 
who was hired back perma-
nently.
  Balut said to Hudanish, “The 
auditor that the PBA hired rec-
ommended Fehrenbach, and 
Tommy, you were on the PBA 
then weren’t you?”
  Hudanish replied, “Yes.”
   Balut also said, “I see Straw 
Donors taking pictures with 
politicians.”
   Another resident said that 
Fehrenbach was the highest 
paid Business Administrator 
in the State.

  Resident Alan Silber said, 
“That is not true and he prob-
ably puts in a lot of hours.”  
Silber also said that the former 
Business Administrator under 
Joe Vas was very sick at the 
end of his career.

Continued from Page 1

Mixing It Up
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LOCAL PERSPECTIVE

THE COMMUNITY VOICEEDITORIAL

Carolyn Maxwell

Acting Editor, Publisher & Advertising Manager

KEEP THOSE  

LETTERS 

COMING

Yes, 
We Will Sit on Letters

www.amboyguardian.com

Two 

Important 

Dates
   Two important dates are 
coming in the Veteran com-
munity, the irst is September 
20th, which is POW/MIA Re-
membrance Day. I guess the 
title is self explanatory, to re-
member all our Veterans from 
all our wars and conlicts who 
never returned home to their 
loved ones. They will forev-
er be true American Heroes, 
please remember them on this 
solemn day.
   The second date is Sep-
tember 30th, which is GOLD 
STAR MOTHER’S DAY, a 
day set aside to recognize the 
families, especially Mothers 
of Americans killed in war 
dates oficially back to World 
War I.
   When a family had a mem-

ber killed in France or else-
where in 1917-18, a gold star 
replaced the blue star on a 
service lag lown in the front 
window of a home.
   Extending that symbolism, 
Congress - through Senate 
Joint Resolution 115 - on June 
23, 1936 (amended in 1985) 
designated the last Sunday in 
September as GOLD STAR 
MOTHER’S DAY.
   While Mothers remain the 
main focus of this noble tradi-
tion, it is important to bear in 
mind that Fathers and siblings 
grieve equally and constitute 
the larger “GOLD STAR” 
family.
   Sadly, few Americans today 
recognize this day, still fewer 
are even aware that a special 
day of recognition exists and 
that it has bestowed honor for 
more than 75 years.
   So please remember these 
two important dates, pause 

and pay tribute to these fami-
lies who gave their Sons and 
Daughters, Husbands and 
Wives, Sisters and Brothers in 
the cause of freedom.
   May God continue to bless 
the UNITED STATES OF 
AMERICA.

Thank you
 Jerry Noonan
Avenel VFW Post 7164

It Sure Does 

Get Confusing
   Although Perth Amboy has 
non-partisan municipal elec-
tions, our candidates for the 
most part still register as be-
longing to a party. Usually we 
ally ourselves with the party 
that has a philosophy and can-
didates we identify with. No 
one can argue that we all have 
the right and that decision 
should be respected even if we 
disagree over which party.  In 
Perth Amboy we have politi-
cians who have changed par-
ties, either through evolving 
beliefs or perhaps through po-
litical expedience. The fact is 
we do not have to tell anyone 
who we actually vote for but if 
you register identifying a polit-
ical party that decision is pub-

lic. Our Mayor, Wilda Diaz is 
a registered Democrat, but has 
been closely identiied with 
Governor Christie - so much 
that residents wonder why she 
just doesn’t change parties. 
Now information has been 
discovered that one of Wilda’s 
running mates has been mak-
ing political contributions to a 
Republican presidential candi-
date. To be clear anyone can 
make a contribution to anyone 
regardless of party afiliation 
except in this case Wilda’s 
running mate also states in her 
bio that she is a 23 year Perth 
Amboy Democratic Commit-
teewoman. I believe that when 
you run for this position you 
are not representing the pub-
lic - you are representing the 
Democrats. That is where your 
allegiance has been pledged. 

That allegiance is not partial, 
it is total. The Mayor, her run-
ning mate and others in her 
inner circle are confusing us. 
Make it public record Wilda, 
and be transparent. It’s okay 
if you are a Republican - just 
come out and say it.

HUFFPOST FUNDRACE
Lisa Nanton
Q4-2011
$201 donation to Ron Paul 
2012 Presidential Campaign

Lisa Nanton
Teacher
Old Bridge BOE
Q1-2008
$523 donation to Ron Paul 
Presidential Campaign

John Siberry
Perth Amboy

Correction
PERTH AMBOY - In the 
9/12/12 issue of the Amboy 
Guardian, the picture featur-
ing Mayoral candidate Bob 
McCoy and New Jersey 
Congressman Bob Menen-
dez should read New Jersey 
Senator Bob Menendez.

Correction
SOUTH AMBOY - In the 
9/5/12 issue of the Amboy 
Guardian, in the Zusette 
Dato Article Southgate Se-
nior Center should read 
Shoregate Adult Condo-
minium Community. It was 
held at the Shoregate Con-
dominium’s community 
events room. Shoregate is a 
55+ Community.

Reference
PERTH AMBOY - The 
spotlight on the Barge in the 
9/12/12 issue of the Amboy 
Guardian referenced a bi-
ography of Alex Vosinas by 
Barbara Booz and his moth-
er-in-law.

  At this moment I have two 
letters that I am sitting on.  
One was emailed to me from 
a person I am not familiar with 
who said she was sending it on 
behalf of a young letter writer. 
I am waiting for a call from the 
parent of that young person to 
contact me to make sure that 
this letter was indeed written 
by their child. The other let-
ter is political and I am having 
someone research that letter to 
make sure that individual did 
indeed write it. Sometimes my 
intuition kicks in and I have to 
listen to it.
   There have been those who 
have written letters to me be-
fore and sometimes that if I 
feel if that writer didn’t write 
that particular letter, I will give 
them a call.
   With a heated race going on 
in the City of Perth Amboy, 
you have to make sure that any 
letter that you receive that is 
political in nature comes from 
a legit am ate source.
   So once my investigator 
makes sure that letter did in-
deed come from that particular 
person, then we will print it. 
But we may have to do some 
editing as some papers state in 
their policy.
  Also we have been getting 
several letters and pictures 
from one particular writer 
complaining about garbage 
not being picked up in certain 
areas of the City.
   This person has sent about 
seven emails addressing gar-

bage. My suggestion to that 
writer is that they should go to 
a Council meeting and perhaps 
the situation will be addressed 
and rectiied quicker. We may 
be requesting that when you 
send an email, or snail mail 
or whatever venue you use to 
contact us that you also leave 
your phone number so we can 
contact you personally.
   Our cell phones are listed 
below in the box as are our 
e-mails. Some people may be 
afraid to write an email and 
have their identity revealed in 
the paper. If you have a fear 
of that, please add your phone 
number and state, “Withhold 
my name upon request.”  I re-
member when I worked for an-
other weekly paper and many 
people forwarded e-mails or 
letters regarding the former 
administration. Some of these 
letter writers were employees 
of the City and feared for their 
jobs.
  The owner of that paper un-
derstood and appreciated that 
they were able to help him ex-
pose corruption by forwarding 
authentic documentation. 
  The Amboy Guardian, too 

will respect that privacy.
   In conclusion when you send 
a correspondence, please have 
a contact number, and if you 
are sending sensitive material 
but you don’t want to be ex-
posed, sign your name and just 
make a notation to withhold 
your name.

C.M.
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IN CLIFFWOOD:
A&P FOOD MARKET .................................................................... 325 ROUTE 35
IN CLIFFWOOD BEACH:
7-ELEVEN.........................................................................................196 ROUTE 35
IN FORDS:
COLONIAL RESTAURANT.....................................366 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
LIBERTY BAGEL CAFE..........................................326 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
METROPOLITAN CAFE .............................................. 747 KING GEORGE’S RD.
PUBLIC LIBRARY............................................................................211 FORD AVE.
ROOSEVELT’S DELI ....................................................684 KING GEORGE’S RD.
SUPER DUPER DELI III .............................................. 650 KING GEORGE’S RD.
IN HOPELAWN:
KRAUSZER’S................................................................683 FLORIDA GROVE RD.
SOVEREIGN BANK ................................................... 571 FLORIDA GROVE RD
IN ISELIN
THOMAS PLOSKONKA C.P.A......................................................1149 GREEN ST.
IN LAURENCE HARBOR:
HOFFMAN’S DELI ............................................................... 5 LAURENCE PKWY.
KRAUSZER’S..........................................................................9 LAURENCE PKWY.
IN MORGAN:
SOUTHPINE LIQUORS .................................................................467 S. PINE AVE.
IN PARLIN:
DAD’S ROYAL BAKERY..................................................3290 WASHINGTON RD.
IN PERTH AMBOY:
ADULT CONTINUING EDUCATION CENTER .................... 178 BARRACKS ST.
ALAMEDA CENTER ............................................................................ 303 ELM ST.
AMBOY CHECK X-CHANGE .........................................................321 MAPLE ST.
AMBOY EYE CARE 94 SMITH ST.
BANCO POPULAR ............................................................................ 633 STATE ST.
BANK OF AMERICA...........................................................................211 SMITH ST.
THE BARGE .......................................................................................201 FRONT ST.
C-TOWN .............................................................................................272 MAPLE ST.
CAPITAL ONE BANK ........................................................................ 313 STATE ST.
CEDENO’S PHARMACY ................................................................... 400 STATE ST.
CITY HALL ............................................................................................260 HIGH ST.
COPA DE ORO .................................................................................... 306 SMITH ST.
CRISPY CHICKEN .................................................... 223 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
EASTSIDE DRY CLEANERS ...............................................................87 SMITH ST.
ELIZABETH CORNER ..................................................................... 175 HALL AVE.
FLOWERS ‘N THINGS .........................................................................69 SMITH ST.
FU LIN ................................................................................................... 79 SMITH ST.
JANKOWSKI COMMUNITY CENTER ................................................ 1 OLIVE ST.
JEWISH RENAISSANCE MEDICAL CENTER ......................... 272A HOBART ST.
KIM’S DRY CLEANERS ...................................................................... 73 SMITH ST.
LAUNDRY FACTORY ............................................... 162 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
LAUNDRY ON MADISON ........................................................285 MADISON AVE.
LAW OFFICES ............................................................................. 708 CARSON AVE.
LEE’S MARKET .................................................................................. 77 SMITH ST.
LEONARDO DAVINCI’S......................................................................71 SMITH ST.
LUDWIG’S PHARMACY .................................................................75 BRACE AVE.
LUIGI’S RISTORANTE ....................................................................... 93 SMITH ST.
MITRUSKA CHIROPRACTIC ...............................................788 CONVERY BLVD.
PETRA BEST REALTY....................................................................... 329 SMITH ST.
PIZZARELI. PIZZA ....................................................232 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
PHO ZONE ....................................................................................... 182A SMITH ST.
POLICE HEADQUARTERS ...................................... 365 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
PORTUGUESE MANOR ........................................................................ 310 ELM ST.
PROVIDENT BANK ........................................................................... 339 STATE ST.
PUBLIC LIBRARY .....................................................................196 JEFFERSON ST.
PUERTO RICAN ASSOCIATION ........................................................100 FIRST ST.
RARITAN BAY AREA Y.M.C.A. ................................365 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
RARITAN BAY MEDICAL CENTER ........................530 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
SANTIBANA TRAVEL ....................................................................... 362 STATE ST.
7-ELEVEN 553 ........................................................................................SAYRE AVE.
SHOP-RITE .............................................................................365 CONVERY BLVD.
SIPOS BAKERY ................................................................................. 365 SMITH ST.
SOVEREIGN BANK ............................................................. 365 CONVERY BLVD.
SUPERIOR DINER..............................................................................464 SMITH ST.
SUPREMO SUPERMARKET ...............................................................270 KING ST.
TOWN DRUGS & SURGICAL ......................................................... 238 SMITH ST.
UNITECH AUTOBODY ......................................................... 284 BERTRAND AVE.
VIDA CHURCH ............................................................................. 189 FAYETTE ST.
WELLS FARGO .................................................................................. 214 SMITH ST.
IN SAYREVILLE:
BOROUGH HALL ................................................................................ 167 MAIN ST.
CHINESE DELITE ................................................................................. 59 MAIN ST.
SENIOR CENTER ................................................................................ 423 MAIN ST.
SUNNYSIDE RESTAURANT .............................................................. 111 MAIN ST.
VENICE PIZZERIA .............................................................................. 881 MAIN ST.
IN SEWAREN:
MOBY DICK’S ...................................................................................351 WEST AVE.
PUBLIC LIBRARY .............................................................................546 WEST AVE.
SEWAREN CORNER DELI ...............................................................514 WEST AVE.
IN SOUTH AMBOY:
AMBOY NATIONAL BANK ......................................................100 N. BROADWAY
BROADWAY BAGELS ...............................................................105 S. BROADWAY
BROADWAY BISTRO ................................................................126 N. BROADWAY 
CENTER DELI ........................................................................250 N. STEVENS AVE.
CITY HALL .................................................................................140 N. BROADWAY
COLLEEN’S KITCHEN ..................................................................... 132 S. PINE ST.
COMMUNITY CENTER ......................................................... 200 O’LEARY BLVD.
FOODTOWN .....................................................................611 BORDENTOWN AVE.
KRAUSZER’S .............................................................................200 N. BROADWAY
KRAUSZER’S ...................................................................717 BORDENTOWN AVE.
MS. LEE’S CUISINE ................................................................... 2087 HIGHWAY 35
PUBLIC LIBRARY ...............................................................100 HOFFMAN PLAZA 
SCIORTINO’S HARBOR LIGHTS 132 .............................................S. BROADWAY
SOUTH AMBOY MEDICAL CENTER............................540 BORDENTOWN AVE.
WELLS FARGO BANK..............................................................116 N. BROADWAY
IN WOODBRIDGE:
CHAMBER OF COMMERCE .................................................................52 MAIN ST.
MAIN ST. FARM ...................................................................................107 MAIN ST.
NEWS & TREATS .................................................................................. 99 MAIN ST.
114 MAIN BAGELS ............................................................................. 114 MAIN ST.
REO DINER ....................................................................................392 AMBOY AVE.
ST. JOSEPH’S SENIORS RESIDENCE ................................1 ST. JOSEPH’S TERR.
WOODBRIDGE VETERINARY GROUP ......................................424 AMBOY AVE.

Where to Find Us . . . 

Community Calendar
Perth Amboy 
WED. Sep 19 Municipal Court, 1:30 p.m., 
   Court House, New Brunswick Ave.
THURS. Sep. 20 Municipal Court, 6 p.m., 
   Court House, New Brunswick Ave.
MON. Sep 24 City Council, Caucus 4:30 p.m.
   City Hall, High Street
TUES. Sep 25 Municipal Court, 9 a.m. and 6 p.m., 
   Court House, New Brunswick Ave.
WED. Sep 26  City Council, Regular, 7 p.m.
   City Hall, High Street

South Amboy
WED Sep 26  City Council, Business 6 p.m.
   City Hall, N. Broadway
  City Council, Regular 7 p.m.
   City Hall, N. Broadway

STAY 

INFORMED!
ATTEND 

PUBLIC 

MEETINGS

Kearny 

Cottage Open
PERTH AMBOY - Come visit 
the historic home of Commo-
dore Lawrence Kearny.  The 
Cottage is located at 63 Ca-
talpa Ave, Perth Amboy, and is 
open on Mondays and Thurs-
days from 2 p.m. - 4 p.m. and 
the last Sunday of the month 
from 2 p.m. - 4 p.m.  The Ke-
arny Cottage needs your help.  
Anyone interested in joining 
the Kearny Cottage Historical 
Society please contact 732-
293-1090.  We are on the web!   
www.KearnyCottage.org

Volunteer 

Fireighters 
Needed

PERTH AMBOY - The Perth 
Amboy Fire Department: Vol-
unteer Division needs mem-
bers.  Accepting men and 
women ages 18 years or older.  
Volunteers must be a Perth 
Amboy resident.  For more in-
formation please contact 732-
442-3430.

Plays in The 

Park
EDISON - J.B.’s Harmoni-
ca - Our 20th Annual Indoor 
Children’s Musical Oct 6, 
7, 13, 14, 20 at 12 & 3 p.m. 
Adults - $7.00, Senior Citi-
zens - $5.00, Children 12 and 
Under Free. Shows play ev-
ery night of the week at 8:30, 
except for Sundays. Plays-in-
the-Park is located 1 block 
south of the Menlo Park Mall 
off of Route 1, in Edison, N.J. 
The turn off is called Grand-
view Avenue. At the top of the 
short hill make your irst right 
on to Pine Drive and the Park 
Rangers will guide you to a 
parking spot.  Fax:732-548-
1484 • Phone: 732-548-2884.  
Please bring a non-perish-
able food item to beneit less 
fortunate residents through 
M.C.C.F.O.O.D.S.  This pro-
gram is funded in part by the 
Middlesex County Board of 
Chosen Freeholders, the Mid-
dlesex County Cultural and 
Heritage Commission with as-
sistance thru a grant provided 
by New Jersey State Council 
on the Arts/Dept of State.

We have a new email address!

AmboyGuardian@gmail.com

HIV Support
PERTH AMBOY — Raritan 
Bay Medical Center is spon-
soring an HIV support group 
meeting on Monday, Sep. 24, 
at 6 p.m. Anyone diagnosed 
with or caring for someone in-
fected with HIV is welcome to 
attend.    Meetings  are  held  
at  the hospital’s  Perth  Am-
boy Division, New Brunswick 
Avenue.
   To register or for more infor-
mation, call (732) 324-5022.
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PERTH AMBOY - “Stories From Perth Amboy” 
Available at Raritan Bay Coffee Company at the 
Historic Train Station, M-F, 6 to 10 a.m. and 5 to 
8 p.m.  Also available at the Barge Restaurant 201 
Front St. Perth Amboy. Mon.-Thu. 11:30 a.m. to 10 
p.m., Fri. 11:30 a.m. to 11 p.m., Sat. 11:30 a.m. to 11 
p.m., Sun. 12 p.m. to 10 p.m. - $20              

Book Signing
PERTH AMBOY - Local au-
thor Katherine Massopust 
will have a book signing of 
her new book, “Stories From 
Perth Amboy” on Wednesday, 
September 26 at 7 p.m. at the 
Raritan Bay Coffee Company 
at the Historic Train Station.

Book Signing
PERTH AMBOY - There will 
be a book signing of local au-
thor Katherine Massopust who 
wrote “Stories From Perth 
Amboy” at the Kearny Cot-
tage, 63 Catalpa Ave., at 2 p.m. 
on Sunday, September 23.  For 
more info call 732-293-1090.

www.amboyguardian.com

COMPLETE ACCOUNTING SERVICES
Thomas M. Ploskonka & Company, P.A.

Certiied Public Accountants

 “My approach to the practice of  

accounting is different than most others’.

Accountants normally respond to their clients’

requests and needs. I go beyond that.”

Visit my Web page for a Free Consultation!

Web: www.ploskonka-cpa.com
1149 Green Street

Iselin. New Jersey 08830
E-mail: tploskonka@comcast.net

Phone (732) 283-0114  Fax: (732) 283-3329

Thomas M. Ploskonka

Enjoying the day

2012 Harbor 

Lights Ball
ISELIN - The Harbor Lights 
Ball will be on Saturday, Sep-
tember 29 from 6:30 p.m. to 
11:30 p.m. at the Woodbridge 
Renaissance Hotel, 515 rte 
1 S., Iselin. Humanitarian 
Award: Gregory M. Ficarra, 
Executive of the Year: Debo-
rah L. Tripod, Excellence 
in Healthcare Award : Mark 
L. Niemiera, MD. The 2012 
theme is “Cirque du Santé” 
and will include music by 
Tim McLoone & the Shirleys, 
cirque performers, dancing 
and a grand auction. Proceeds 
from the ball beneit the medi-
cal center’s “Broadening Our 
Vision, Securing Our Future” 
a construction and renova-
tion project. This project will 
improve the availability of a 
diverse range of outpatient 
services, support emergency 
medical services, renovate 
patient rooms at Raritan Bay 
Medical Center’s Old Bridge 
and Perth Amboy campuses 
and construct a new ambula-
tory surgical center at the Old 
Bridge campus. If you would 
like more information about 
the Ball or to receive a formal 
invitation, contact the Founda-
tion at 732-324-5374 or visit 
www.rbmcfoundation.org.

The band entertains

Enjoying Sayreville Day!

Sayreville Day - September 16, 2012
*Photos by Aaron Beers

Superman balloon

Send Your Events to 

Carolyn at  

Crlynmxwll@aol.com and 

to Katherine 

at KMass514@gmail.com

Ads Sell
Call Carolyn

732-896-4446
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A young observerJust Us 

Cruisers
SAYREVILLE/SOUTH AM-
BOY -  Come join us at Cruisin 
The Peterpank Diner With The 
Just Us Cruisers Car Club, 
DJ Richie, The Flash & Crew  
from 6 p.m. to 9 p.m. start-
ing  Jun 01 (Clubs & Orga-
nizations) every Friday night 
until Sept. 21.In The Parking 
Lot Of The Peterpank Diner at 
967 Route 9 North In Sayre-
ville/South Amboy . This year 
we will make Donations To, 
The Camp Dill Foundation, 
Sayreville Brain Injured Chil-
dren.  We Welcome Everyone 
At Our Cruise Nights Clas-
sic Cars, Customs, Trucks & 
Custom Motorcycles, If You 
Drive It. You Can Bring It. For 
Info Call: Richie @ 732-525-
0412.  For Info The Night Of 
The Show Call The Diner @ 
732-721-2850  Live DJ Music 
From The 50’s,60’s,70’s,80’s, 
Kids Games, Trophies Ev-
ery Night & It’s FREE Door 
Prizes, 50/50 ,Food, and 
More. Come And Enjoy A 
Great Night Of Fun...We Are 
A Member Of The Central NJ 
Car Club Association.Com. 

Showing the Mexican spirit

Enjoying the Car Show

Conversational 

Italian
PERTH AMBOY - Interested 
in learning to speak Italian?  
The Kearny Cottage Historical 
Society is offering Italian les-
sons on Wednesday evenings 
beginning on September 19 at 
6 p.m. at the Kearny Cottage, 
63 Catalpa Ave., Perth Amboy.  
$60 for eight weeks. For  more 
info call 732-293-1090. 

Dunk A 

South Amboy 

Politician And 

Help The 

Library
SOUTH AMBOY - Dunk 
some of the well-known per-
sonalities of South Amboy 
and help the Dowdell Library 
at the same time. A dunking 
booth in front of City Hall will 
feature former South Amboy 
Mayor John O’Leary, City 
Councilman Mickey Gross, 
South Amboy High School 
teacher and coach Tony Gon-
salves, and drum major for the 
illustrious Colonel D.B. Kelly 
Pipes & Drums of the AOH of 
South Amboy, George Fuller.
The booth sponsored by the 
Dowdell Library Foundation 
and Assemblyman John S. 
Wisniewski, will be part of the 
Arts Festival and Street Fair 
held on Sunday, September 
23 from 11:00 am to 4:00 pm 
on Broadway, South Amboy. 
All funds raised will be used 
to purchase new computers for 
the Sadie Pope Dowdell Pub-
lic Library of South Amboy. 

Look at those engines!

Raising the Mexican Flag in City Hall Circle

Carving the meat A fun illed afternoon

A band played Mexican tunes

Nice Ride! The Batmobile!

Raising the Mexican Flag & the Mexican Festival - Perth Amboy - September 14, 15, 2012
*Photos by  Paul W. Wang

Sayreville Car Show - September 16, 2012
*Photos by Aaron Beers
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Artfest & 

Street Fair
SOUTH AMBOY - The City 
of South Amboy Artfest & 
Street Fair will be on Sunday, 
Sept. 23 11a.m. until 4 p.m.  
Rain Date: Sunday Sept. 30.  
Crafters, artists, food vendors.  
Free Hands on activities.  Free 
Entertainment on Broadway!  
Free admission and parking.  
For vendor info call 732-316-
8213.

Free Personal 

Growth & 

Leadership 

Development 

Class
PERTH AMBOY - During the 
month of October Leo Sierra, 
a leadership development con-
sultant is hosting two free study 
groups that will meet once a 
week for 5 straight weeks. The 
irst class is called “The 21 Ir-
refutable Laws of Leadership” 
which is based on one of John 
C. Maxwell best sellers and is 
about learning the proven laws 
that will increase your lead-
ership ability and allow you 
to produce better results. The 
second class is called “The 15 
Laws of Growth” based on the 
upcoming new book by John 
Maxwell to be released dur-
ing the month of October and 
is about learning the key in-
gredients for personal growth 
& allow you to reach your po-
tential . These two groups are 
Free of charge and are open 
only to serious individuals that 
are looking for growth oppor-
tunities. For any questions or 
to register for the class you can 
email Leo Sierra at leopoldo_
sierra@hotmail.com or check 
his website at www.leosierra.
info Class Schedule: The 21 
Irrefutable Laws of Leader-
ship (Every Tuesday at 7 p.m. 
October 2, 9,16, 23, 30). The 
15 Laws of Personal Growth 
(Every Thursday at 7 p.m. 
October 4,11, 18, 25, Nov 1). 
Location: 189 Fayette Street, 
Perth Amboy.

Janice 

Garbolino 

Memorial 5K 

Walk/Run
SOUTH AMBOY - Cancer. 
The Big ‘C’ - call it what you 
will. Years ago it seemed like a 
death sentence but today with 
the work being done the Lance 
Armstrong Foundation, more 
people are ighting the battle 
and winning, going on to live 
happy, healthy and productive 
lives.
    It is the focus on the living 
that brought the YMCA and 
the Lance Armstrong Foun-
dation together, united in a 
common purpose — to ensure 
that cancer survivors and their 
families receive the help and 
support they need to thrive.
Each year 400+ walkers and 
runners participate in the an-
nual Janice Garbolino Me-
morial 5K event, walking or 
running in memory of Janice 
Garbolino, the former Health 
& Wellness Director of the 
Metuchen Branch YMCA, 
who lost her battle with breast 
cancer in 2002.
   Janice would be pleased and 
proud of the work the YMCA 
is undertaking with the Lance 
Armstrong Foundation in her 
memory. 

   NEW THIS YEAR: The Y 
is asking participants to get in-
volved by not only walking or 
running in memory or in honor 
of a loved one, but by raising 
funds in support of the pro-
gram. Participants can simply 
and easily establish a personal 
fundraising page and set a per-
sonal or team fundraising goal 
by visiting the YMCA’s web-
site (www.ymcaofmewsa.org) 
and clicking on the Garbolino 
5K Event link.
   EVENT DETAILS: The 
event will take place at Roo-
sevelt Park in Edison NJ on 
Saturday, morning Septem-
ber 22nd.  Registration will 
be accepted in advance at 
the branches of the YMCA 
of Metuchen, Edison, Wood-
bridge & South Amboy and 
online through midnight on 
Thursday, September 20th. 
After September 20th, partici-
pants can register the morning 
of the event, from 7:30 AM 
until 8:15 AM at Lakeview 
School in Roosevelt Park (the 
location of the start and inish 
of the 5K).

Women’s 

Health & 

Wellness Fair
SOUTH AMBOY - The Y 
celebrates Women’s Health & 
Fitness in September as a way 
to promote the importance and 
value of women maintaining 
a healthy lifestyle.  The South 
Amboy Branch YMCA will 
be hosting a Women’s Health 
& Wellness Fair on Tuesday, 
September 25th from 9 a.m. 
-1 p.m. to engage women in 
healthful activities together.  
Women throughout the com-
munity are invited to partici-
pate in the scheduled events 
that will take place at the 
South Amboy Y, located at 200 
John T. O’Leary Blvd, South 
Amboy.

   Scheduled activities for the 
morning include Zumba Ton-
ing, Cycling, and Tai Chi 
classes, blood pressure screen-
ings from Raritan Bay Medi-
cal Center, free lu shots by Dr. 
Ofori-Behome of Adom Fam-
ily Medicine, dark chocolate 
giveaways, and more!.   Please 
visit our website for a com-
plete schedule of activities for 
the day: www.ymcaofmewsa.
org.
   All women in the community 
are invited to join us and cel-
ebrate at the South Amboy Y’s 
Women’s Health & Wellness 
Fair.  For more information, 
please call the Y’s Welcome 
Desk at 732-553-9622.

Public Notice
PERTH AMBOY - The Hous-
ing Authority of the City of 
Perth Amboy is no longer ac-
cepting new applications for 
senior/disabled housing effec-
tive Tuesday, September 4, 
2012. New applications will 
only be accepted for the public 
housing program from Perth 
Amboy residents displaced 
by a natural disaster. Contact 
(732) 826-3110 for further in-
formation or questions. 

 
Learn About Balancing Hormones Naturally and Rapid Weight Loss

Do You Suffer From:

High Blood Pressure       Trouble Sleeping
Digestive Problems        Low Sex Drive

Hot Flashes

Do you want to get rid of these symptoms?
Do you want to Lose Weight Rapidly Safely and Naturally?

Call 732-324-4300
         788 Convery Blvd. 

          Perth Amboy NJ 08861

Open House
PERTH AMBOY… Raritan 
Bay Medical Center’s new 
Center for Balance is holding 
an open house Tuesday, Sep-
tember 25, 4 to 6:30 p.m. in 
the Blue Wing, 3rd loor, 530 
New Brunswick Ave., Perth 
Amboy. 

   At the center, an experienced 
team of multidisciplinary, 
specialized professionals di-
agnose and provide treatment 
for a full range of balance dis-
orders, including; dizziness, 
vertigo and dificulty judging 
distance, integrating state-of-
the-art diagnostic testing and 
individualized plans of care 
that help patients improve 
function, avoid falls, and en-
hance quality of life. Treat-
ment options may include 
medical treatment and/or ves-
tibular rehabilitation therapy 
at one of the center’s four con-
venient outpatient locations.
   Balance testing and treatment 
are covered by most insurance 
plans. For more information or 
to receive a brochure, call 732-
324-5030.

New Jersey 

Senior Olympics
Perth Amboy Winners

Press Release
PERTH AMBOY - Mayor 
Wilda Diaz and the Ofice 
on Aging are proud to an-
nounce that two Perth Am-
boy participants NJ Senior 
Olympics held in Wood-
bridge Township over the 
weekend obtained medals in 
the billiards competition. 
   “I want to congratulate 
Steve Rader, (in photo: 
right) who won a gold medal 
and Angel Aviles, (in photo: 
left) who won a bronze med-
al,” said Mayor Wilda Diaz. 
   To learn more about the 
Ofice on Aging activities 
and upcoming events, please 
visit the Human Services 
webpage for a calendar list-
ing or call 732-826-1690. 

Ben Franklin’s 

Life and 

Contributions
PERTH AMBOY - The Pro-
prietary House Museum, lo-
cated at 149 Kearny Avenue, 
Perth Amboy invites you to 
enjoy tea and cake with Phila-
delphia’s most famous citizen.  
Barry Stevens will amuse and 
delight you during this presen-
tation of Dr. Ben Franklin’s 
life and his contributions.  The 
price is $15 pp. Reservations 
are required.  Please call 732-
826-5527 and leave your name, 
phone number and number at-
tending.  Space is limited.  The 
event is to take place on Sep-
tember 23, 2012 at 2 p.m. The 
Proprietary House Museum is 
owned by the State of NJ, ad-
min. by DEP, Dept. of Parks & 
Forestry, operated by the Pro-
prietary House Assoc, a 501c3 
nonproit organization. 

Fall Festival 

in South River
SOUTH RIVER – Saints 
Peter & Paul Russian Ortho-
dox Church, 76 Whitehead 
Ave., will be holding a Fall 
Festival in the church hall 
located behind the church on 
Sat., Sept. 29th from 10 a.m. 
to 4 p.m.  Pierogies, potato 
pancakes, stuffed cabbage, 
soups, blintzes, babkas and 
more.   Also featuring live 
entertainment, gift baskets, 
50/50 rafle and religious 
and imported items for sale.  
Admission is FREE!   www.
saintpeterandpaul.org for 
directions.

Royal Garden 

Club by the Bay 

Monthly 

Meeting
PERTH AMBOY - Royal Gar-
den Club by the Bay monthly 
meeting:  Wed. Oct. 3 at 7:30 
p.m. at the St. Peter’s Rectory, 
188 Rector St., Perth Amboy.  
Learn about our activities and 
how to participate.  We wel-
come new members.  This 
month, there will be a slide 
show on the Floriade, which is 
the 2012 World Horticultural 
Expo, Venlo - The Nether-
lands.  It is the largest lower 
show in the world held once 
every ten years and ends Oct. 
7.  Photos by Nona Henderson, 
who attended in April 2012.   

Accepting 

Registrations
PERTH AMBOY - Assump-
tion Catholic School is accept-
ing registrations.
   Consider a Catholic Educa-
tion for your child at Assump-
tion Catholic School that next 
year will celebrate a milestone 
- 50 years of excellence in ed-
ucation!
   Our school has an Open 
Enrollment Policy accepting 
applicants at any time. ACS 
summer ofice hours are from 
8 a.m. to 2:30 p.m. on Tuesday 
through Thursday. We have 
openings for the 2012-2013 
school year in grades: Pre-K 
(age 4), K,1,2,3,4,7 & 8. Visit 
us at www.assumptioncatho-
licschool.net or call the school 
at 732-826-8721. Our Princi-
pal will give you a tour and 
answer any questions.

Knitting Circle
SOUTH AMBOY - There will 
be a Knitting Circle on the 
irst and third Tuesday each 
month at 6 p.m. at the Dowdell 
Library, 100 Harold G. Hoff-
man Plaza, South Amboy.  For 
more info call 732-721-6060.
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A crowd listens to the speakers

Fireighters and Police The High School Choir sang

Prayers for families and victimsMayor Diaz with Police Chaplains

Woodbridge Fire Department

9-11 Ceremony - September 11, 2012 - 
Perth Amboy *Photos by Bob Ned

Beer Fest
WOODBRIDGE - Wood-
bridge’s 6th Annual Charity 
Central Jersey Beer Fest 2012 
will be on September 22nd, 
from 1 p.m. to 5 p.m. at Parker 
Press Park, 400 Rahway Ave., 
Woodbridge. Live entertain-
ment, great food, souvenir 
sampler glass. Tickets avail-
able at J.J. Bitting Brewing 
Co. and at the gate. $25 for 
drinking adults and $15 for 
non-drinkers. (Kids under 12 
yrs. free.)  For more info call 
732-634-2929

2012 Farmer’s 

Market
WOODBRIDGE - Wood-
bridge Wednesdays! There 
will be a Farmer’s Market Ev-
ery Wednesday from June 20 
to Sept. 26 from 3 p.m. to 8:30 
p.m. Rain or Shine! at Parker 
Press Park, Rahway Ave.  Free 
Parking.  Looking for local 
specialty vendors, crafters 
and artists to set up tables and 
booths!  Contact Kelly Reidy 
at the Mayors Ofice for more 
details.  732-634-4500 ext. 
6494.

Tot Time & 

Storytime
SOUTH AMBOY - There 
will be Tot Time - (Ages 0-2) 
on Mondays at 10:15 a.m. 
and Storytime (Ages 3-5) on 
Wednesdays at 3:30 p.m. at the 
Sadie Pope Dowdell Library, 
100 Harold G. Hoffman Plaza 
South Amboy.  For more info 
call 732-721-6060.

Our Lady of 

Fatima 

Rosary Rally
SOUTH AMBOY- There will 
be a Rosary Rally on Sat-
urday, October 13th from 1 
p.m. to 2 p.m. Location: The 
Gazebo on Bordentown Ave. 
(between South Pine Ave. & 
Stevens Ave. South Amboy) 
All are invited to attend the 
rally.  It is part of a nationwide 
rally to Our Lady of Fatima 
by the Faith Sharing Group 
and friends of St. Mary’s 
R.C. Church in South Amboy. 
In this time of trouble in our 
land we need more prayer. For 
more info call 732-588-5272.

9-11 Ceremony - September 11, 2012  - Woodbridge 
*Photos by Carolyn Maxwell & Joe Bayona

Listening to the Ceremony Veteran organizations pay tribute

The crowd listens

Art Reception
THURSDAY, Sept. 20th - 7 
p.m. - Art Reception for Hearts 
of Nature by Noelle Jimenez 
Zaleski, at Raritan Bay Cof-
fee, inside the Perth Amboy 
train station, 233 Smith St., 
Perth Amboy NJ.  Noelle is a 
nationally recognized nature 
photographer.  You will be 
amazed by her stunning slide
show and photo exhibit which 
runs through October.  Doors 
open at 6:30 p.m.
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Volunteers 

Needed
PERTH AMBOY - Catho-
lic Charities Diocese of 
Metuchen Connections Pro-
gram is looking for both 
men and women to partici-
pate in one-to-one activities 
and become a mentor to the 
youth of Middlesex County 
and Franklin Township.  For 
more info call Jeanette at 
732-738-1323 or email jna-
donley@ccdom.org.

Amboy Guardian 

Subscriptions are only $65 per year for 50 

issues mailed to anywhere in the U.S.A.

For more info Contact Carolyn at 

732-896-4446Rally for 

Wilda Diaz
PERTH AMBOY - Mayor Diaz 
is having a rally on Thursday 
Sept. 20 at the Ironworkers 
Hall on Market Street, 6 p.m. 
to 8 p.m. Please come out and 
bring your friends. If anyone 
is interested in volunteering to 
help with the Campaign, doing 
anything, it would be appreci-
ated: Manning the HQ, mak-
ing phone calls from HQ, giv-
ing out information, hosting 
a coffee cloche, walking with 
the candidates. 

Paella Party
PERTH AMBOY - St. Peter’s 
Episcopal Church presents A 
Paella Party catered by: Little 
Spain Restaurant. Come en-
joy an afternoon of good food, 
music & entertainment by a 
Flamenco dancer. September 
30 from 11:30 a.m. to 2 p.m. 
at The Boyd House Lawn, 222 
Rector St., Perth Amboy. Price 
$20 adults, $15 children, (un-
der 12 free). Contact Elaine 
732-738-4138 or Betty 848-
203-4642 for more info.

LAW OFFICES OF
ERALDES E. CABRERA
                        Specializing In    

• Civil Litigation
• Matrimonial
• Immigration
• Bankruptcy
• Real Estate

Ofices Located At:
708 Carson Ave., Perth Amboy, NJ 08861 (732)826-5020

1201 E. Grand St., Unit 3A, Elizabeth, NJ 07201 (908)351-0957

Atlantic City 

Bus Trip
PERTH AMBOY - Bus trip 
to Bally’s Hotels and Casi-
nos from St. Peter’s Epis-
copal Church Parish House, 
183 Rector St., Perth Amboy 
on Sunday, October 14. Bus 
leaves at 12 Noon. Tickets are 
$27 p.p. Sponsored by St. Pe-
ter’s Mother’s Guild. Tickets 
can be purchased by calling 
Ann at 732-442-8875. Enjoy a 
day of fun with your friends.

Firemen’s Convention - Wildwood, NJ - 
September 14, 15, 2012  * Photos by Katherine Massopust

WILDWOOD - South Amboy Fire Department Marches in 
the parade in the Firemen’s Convention in Wildwood, NJ. 
South Amboy won 11 trophies, including best marching unit 
over 20 people.

We are on the Web!
www.AmboyGuardian.com
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Bait Shop Report

Catch of the Week! *photo submitted

The Fisherman’s Corner
By: Eddy Gonzalez
PERTH AMBOY - What a 
week ! All the local piers 
were packed  seems like ish 
are everywhere and a nice as-
sortment to boot. Spots and 
cocktail blues are dominating 
the action off the piers using a 
small piece of worm or a small 
piece of ish bites make spots 
a easy catch. Peanut bunker 
been doing their dance along 
the piers with cocktail blues 
giving chase and weakish un-
derneath. Some of the old salts 
using a small treble hook snag 
them then live line them with 
great success. While others 
use spearing and poppers or 
small lures with just as good 
results. 
   This week quit a few nice 
looking luke were brought 
into the shop caught on spear-
ing and killies so they’re still 
plenty to be caught by season’s 

end, September 28th.
    Weakish action also been 
doing well the best in years 
caught on peanut bunkers 
worms and squid the regula-
tions are 13’’ 1 ish per person. 
   So where are the porgys ?
   Porgys normally start com-
ing in the second to third week 
of September reports  of  mon-
ster porgys are coming in from 
the second rock pile by the 20 
can high lo rigs and fresh sand 
worms been doing the trick.
   Sea bass though not common 
to have great size locally have 
been caught at the rock piles 
and wrecks as well with a few 
keeper size.
   Stripers - schoolies  been 
making their runs, the night 
shift has been catching them 
on worms. shcoolies = throw 
back,  using circle hooks en-
sure a safer release. 
   I recently overheard some-
one say if the striper its in 
the pan they’re taking it. My 
response was remember we 
ish because we enjoy it the 

thrill of the hunt the action of 
the ight the relaxation of the 
water the hope of catching the 
big one. We all have our rea-
sons why we love the sport so 
much for me its therapeutic. 
In this day and age were not 
ishing to survive ( if you are 
then inquire about government 
assistance because man you’re 
in trouble) We ish to relax to 
getaway for awhile and most 
of all have fun. Taking under-
size ish is wrong and ines are 
not cheap. Giving away shorts 
is not any better than keeping 
it yourself.  It’s a touchy sub-
ject but one that needed to be 
addressed.
  Saturday September 15th 
9:00 am to 12:00pm  was Perth 
Amboy’s annual ishing derby.  
   Fall is the time to catch 
the big striper that everyone 
dreams of so make sure you 
got your gear setup for some 
hardcore ishing. Perth Amboy 
piers and beaches have proven 
in the past to provide 30+ lb 
stripers. I ‘myself have caught 

a few of them. Many local 
novice assume when it gets 
cold out it is done. Wrong, this 
is when it starts. Right through 
to December 31st. Black ish 
starts November 16th. Just so 
you can get an idea this year 
the marina are allowing boats 
to stay into November so the 
boaters can capitalize on the 
action. I can’t wait!
   Remember before your next 

trip stop in American Pride 
Bait and Tackle, 211 front St. 
(732)486-8396, a new website 
with a online store is currently 
in the works stay tuned for 
more updates were you heard 
it irst The Amboy Guardian.

Meet ‘N Greet
PERTH AMBOY - Business 
owners can promote their busi-
ness by being a sponsor at a bi-
monthly Meet ‘N Greet at the 
Barge Restaurant, 201 Front 
Street, Perth Amboy. At our 
August Meet ‘N Greet, we had 
over 50 businesses attending. 
For more information please 
call: Milton Paris, President 
of Getting Ahead in Business: 
732-306-0040. The next Meet 
‘N Greet will be on Wednes-
day, November 14, 2012 from 
5:30 p.m. to 8:30 p.m.  Free 
Advertising in Newspaper 
plus Constant Contact. Free 
buffet.

3rd Annual 

Taste of 

Perth Amboy
PERTH AMBOY - Mark your 
calendars.  The Friends of the 
Perth Amboy Free Public Li-
brary are hosting the 3rd An-
nual Taste of Perth Amboy on 
Tuesday, October 2 from 6 
p.m. - 9 p.m. in the Commu-
nity Center of St. Demetrios 
Greek Orthodox Church on 
Sadowski Parkway and Wiste-
ria St. in Perth Amboy.  Sam-
ple the various cuisines of the 
diverse neighborhood restau-
rants and enjoy an evening of 
food, fun and friendship.  All 
funds raised will support the 
renovation and expansion of 
the library.
   Music will be provided by 
D.J. Andy Rios.  The evening 
will also include door prizes 
and a silent auction.  
    This year the Friends of the 
Library, working in conjunc-
tion with the Kearney Cot-
tage Historical Society, will 
be participating in a 2013 
Calendar Fundraiser Project.   
Old restored photographs of 
Perth Amboy will be added to 
a 2013 calendar and available 
for sale at the Taste.  Proceeds 
from the sale of the calendars 
will beneit both groups.   
    Tickets are $30 per per-
son.  For information, contact 
Barbara at 732-826-9466 or 
Rozalia at 973-763-4273/732-
904-8703 or e-mail friendsof-
perthamboylibrary@gmail.
com.  Tickets will also avail-
able at the door.

Elvis Tribute 

Show
PORT READING - There will 
be an Elvis Tribute Show star-
ring Rick Alviti on Saturday, 
October 27 at St. Anthony of 
Padua, 436 Port Reading Ave., 
Port Reading. Doors open at 
6 p.m. Show at 8 p.m. Tickets 
are $45 pp. Includes: show, hot 
buffet, dessert, coffee, tea & 
soda. B.Y.O.B.  Seats are lim-
ited. First Come First Served. 
For more info or tickets call 
Francine at 732-881-3619.

Do you or someone you know have 
Old Photographs or Documents?
 The Kearny Cottage Historical Society is
Looking for Old Photos and Documents of 

Perth Amboy, South Amboy, 
Woodbridge, Fords, etc. (Local Area)

For an Archiving Project - Your Photos & Documents 
will be scanned into digital format & returned to you.

For more info please call 732-293-1090

Tricky Tray
Blessed John Paul II Parish

500 State Street, Perth Amboy
Sunday, October 7, 2012

Doors Open Noon
Drawings Starts 2 p.m.

Polish and American Food Sold
Entrance at Rear of School
No one Under 18 Admitted

Prizes - 42” TV, Luggage Set, Nintendo 3DS

Over 300 More Prizes!

Donation $8

For Tickets, Call Carol at 732-826-5362

license RL-2998
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LOOKING BACK

Senior Scene

Happenings
Perth Amboy
TODAY, Sep. 19 Simpson Seniors, 10 a.m., 
      Williamson Hall, High St.
 • Holy Rosary Seniors, 12:30 p.m., Auditorium,  
      Florida Grove Rd.
 • St. Stephen’s Seniors, 1 p.m., Cafeteria, State St.
 • Holy Trinity Seniors, 1 p.m., 
        Church Hall, Lawrie & Johnstone St
THURS., Sep. 20 The Cathedral International Seniors, 9:30 a.m., 
       Family Life Center, Madison Ave.
MON., Sep. 24  St. James Golden Girls, 10 a.m., 
  Fellowship Hall,  Commerce St.
TUES., Sep. 25 Holy Spirit Seniors, 12:30 p.m.,
       Church Hall, Brace Ave.
 • Market Square Seniors, 1 p.m., 
     Presbyterian Center, Market St.
WED  Sep. 26 Simpson Seniors, 10 a.m., 
      Williamson Hall, High St.
 • Holy Rosary Seniors, 12:30 p.m., Auditorium,  
      Florida Grove Rd.
 • St. Stephen’s Seniors, 1 p.m., Cafeteria, State St.
THURS., Sep. 28  The Cathedral International Seniors, 9:30 a.m., 
  Family Life Center, Madison Ave.
South Amboy
MON.  Oct. 1  St. Mary’s Seniors, noon, 
     Senior Center, S. Stevens Ave. 
WED.  Oct. 3   South Amboy Seniors, noon, 
      Senior Center, S. Stevens Ave.

SEND US YOUR 

CLUB NEWS

Answers

From Puzzle

On Page 15

PERTH AMBOY - Circa 1915. On December 11, 1913 - the YMCA lays its cornerstone at 182 Jefferson 
Street. The building was destroyed by ire in 1997. 

*Photo courtesy of Perth Amboy Free Public Library

This photo was restored under a grant for the Kearny Cottage Archiving project by the Middlesex Cul-

tural and Heritage Commission

Book Sale
PERTH AMBOY - There is an 
ongoing book sale at the Perth 
Amboy Free Public Library, 
196 Jefferson St., Perth Am-
boy.  Fill a bag for $5.  New 
books have arrived!  Mystery, 
Classics, Popular Authors! 
Book Dealers Welcome. For 
more info call 732-826-2600.  
There are also books for sale at 
Raritan Bay Coffee Company 
(at the Historic Train Station) 

Open Mic
PERTH AMBOY - There will 
be an Poetry and Music Open 
Mic Night every 2nd and 4th 
Thursday of the month from 
7 p.m. to 10 p.m. at the Perth 
Amboy Gallery for the Arts, 
339 Reade St., Perth Amboy.  
Come show off your talent.  
For more information contact 
732-826-1690 ext. 4325.

Kidz Wii Club
SOUTH AMBOY - The 
Kidz Wii Club will meet ev-
ery Friday at 3:30 p.m. at 
the Sadie Pope Dowdell Li-
brary, 100 Harold G. Hoff-
man Plaza,South Amboy.  For 
more info call 732-721-6060.

BARGAIN

WAREHOUSE
STORE

BLOWOUT SALE!

DRASTICALLY
REDUCED PRICES!

MEN’S, WOMEN’S
AND CHILDREN’S CLOTHING!

“RECESSION SPECIALS!!!”

Located at 5 Paddock Street, Avenel, NJ 07001
(Next to Woodbridge Child Diagnostic & Treatment Center)

732-855-1400, Ext. 242

OPEN FRIDAY 8 A.M. TO 3 P.M.
VISA, MC, AMEX and DISCOVER

WOW!

Amboy Guardian 

Subscriptions are only $65 per year 

for 50 issues mailed to anywhere 

in the U.S.A.

For more info

Contact Carolyn at 

732-896-4446

Our Lady of 

Victories 

Oktoberfest
SAYREVILLE - Our Lady 
of Victories Parish will hold 
a parish Oktoberfest on Sat-
urday, September 29 from 7 
p.m. to 11 p.m. in Monsignor 
Dalton Hall. Bernie’s Orches-
tra will provide entertaining 
German music. The Bayern 
Verein dancers will entertain 
throughout the evening. A 
delicious German dinner will 
be served along with mouth-
watering German desserts. 
German beer, wine, soda, and 
water will be available all eve-
ning. The ticket price is $35 
and can be purchased by call-
ing either Teri at (732) 727-
7639 or Joe at (732) 257-4351.
Tables of ten can be reserved 
for the event. Tickets will also 
be available after all Masses 
starting on August 19.

Record 

Collection
PARILIN - The Friends of the 
Sayreville Public Library will 
continue its program of record 
donations. The records must 
be either 45’s or 33 1/3. We do 
not accept 78’s. Please contact 
Teri at 732-727-7639 for fur-
ther information or if you have 
large record donations. 

Zumba Class
PERTH AMBOY - Here is 
what you have been wait-
ing for... we have started a 
brand new Zumba class ev-
ery Monday at 7 p.m. and will 
be taught by one of the best 
Zumba instructors in our area. 
So, we invite you and all your 
friends to come work-out with 
us every Monday night. There 
is no better way to start of the 
week than burning some calo-
ries, losing weight and elimi-
nating stress while having 
fun!  Admission: $5 per per-
son. Address: 189 Fayette St., 
Perth Amboy (Entrance by the 
Administration building). For 
questions call: (732) 709-0129

We Keep You 

Moving
OLD BRIDGE & WOOD-
BRIDGE - The Human Mo-
tion Institute at Raritan Bay 
Medical Center is sponsoring 
a free, three-part educational 
series “We Keep You Mov-
ing” Thursdays, September 
20, 27 and October 4, 6 to 7 
p.m., at two locations; the 
medical center’s Old Bridge 
location 3 Hospital Plaza, and 
at the YMCA at the Wood-
bridge Community Center, 
600 Main Street.
   The September 20 session 
is “Ouch my Aching Back!” 
Living with Lower Back Pain, 
September 27 is A Weekend 
Warrior & Student Athlete’s 
Guide to Preventing Common 
Sports Injuries and October 4 
is “Feeling Swell Even with 
Swelling” Improved Living 
with Arthritis. All sessions 
will be presented by clini-
cal specialists. For more in-
formation or to register, call 
1-800-DOCTORS.

50+ Art Show
PERTH AMBOY - Looking 
for artists for an upcoming 
event in October at the Kearny 
Cottage. There will be an art 
display from local artists 50+ 
years to have their work on 
display at the Kearny Cottage, 
63 Catalpa Ave., Perth Amboy.  
For more info call Paul at 732-
293-1090
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Tell Our Advertisers
YOU SAW IT IN

If you wish to publish a Novena in The Amboy Guardian, you
may use this coupon.

Send check or money order (no cash), include your name and
telephone, to: THE AMBOY GUARDIAN,
P.O. Box 127 • PERTH AMBOY • NJ 08862

How to Publish a Novena

A Petition to 

St. Joseph
A Petition to 

St. Jude

Cost $10. 
Pre-payment required.

Name ________________________

Address 
_____________________________

Phone_(____)__________________

Initials at end of prayer ___________

Please circle one prayer, and return 
form with check or money order to:

The Amboy Guardian
P.O. Box 127

Perth Amboy, NJ
08862

Dear St. Joseph, head of the 
most perfect household, foster 
father of Jesus and guardian 
of His mother Mary, I coni-
dently place myself and all my 
concerns under your care and 
protection. I ask that, through 
your powerful intercession 
with God, you obtain for me all 
the help and graces that I need 
for my spiritual and temporal 
welfare and in particular, the 
special favor I now ask there 
mention or think of your home 
sale or any other petition, es-
pecially family needs. Good 
St. Joseph, I know with coni-
dence, that your prayers on my 
behalf will be heard by God 
and that He will grant my re-
quest, if it be for His glory and 
my greater good. Thank you St. 
Joseph, for having responded to 
my call.  Amen.          G.T.A.

May the sacred Heart of Je-
sus be adored, gloriied, 
loved and preserved through-
out the world, now and for-
ever. Sacred Heart of Jesus, 
have mercy on us. St. Jude, 
worker of Miracles, pray 
for us. St. Jude, helper of 
the hopeless, pray for us.
Say this prayer nine times a 
day for nine days. It has nev-
er been known to fail. Pub-
lication must be promised.          
               Thank you, St. Jude

                                                 F.M.J.

Prayer To St. Claire

Prayer To Blessed Mother

Prayer To Blessed Virgin

St. Jude Novena

For Employment

Prayer To Holy Spirit

Thanksgiving Novena

Pray The Rosary

Prayer To St. Jude

Novena To St. Anthony

Novena To St. Joseph

OTHER ___________

Prayer To The 

Blessed Virgin
(Never known to fail)

O Most Beautiful Flower of 
Mt. Carmel, Fruitful Vine, 
Splendor of Heaven, Blessed 
Mother of the Son of God, 
Immaculate Virgin, assist me 
in my necessity. O Star of the 
Sea, help me and show me 
herein you are my Mother. O 
Holy Mary, Mother of God,  
Queen of Heaven and Earth, 
I humbly beseech you from 
the bottom of my heart to suc-
cor me in my necessity (make 
request). There are none that 
can withstand your power. O 
Mary conceived without sin, 
pray for us who have recourse 
to thee (3 times). Holy Mary, I 
place this cause in your hands 
(3 times).  K.M.
Say this prayer for 3 consecu-

tive days. You must publish it, 

and it will be granted to you.

Ads Sell 
Call Carolyn

732-896-4446

To Place Your Classiied:
First 10 Words .... $6.50

5 Weeks for .... $30
Each additional word over 10 words 30¢

Tel:

1st Annual 

Bras for a 

Cause
PERTH AMBOY - The Wom-
en’s Council of Realtors Mid-
dlesex County Chapter Pres-
ents the 1st Annual Bras for a 
Cause on Friday, September 
21 from 6 p.m. to 9 p.m. at 
Seabra’s Armory At The Wa-
terfront, Perth Amboy. The 
Middlesex County Chapter 
of Women’s Council of Real-
tors is proud to partner with 
the American Cancer Society 
to pursue a cure for cancer. 
Cancer affects and touches the 
lives of everyone, each week 
in Middlesex County a stag-
gering 75 people are diagnosed 
with cancer and 26 people lose 
their battle. Together we can 
make a difference helping our 
families and friends who are 
affected by this terrible dis-
ease. 
   What is Bras For A Cause? 
Local sponsors, both individu-
als and companies, decorate 
bras in various themes to be 
modeled during a live Auction 
by enthusiastic volunteer male 
models. Themes range from 
representing their business to 
holidays, hobbies, jokes, spe-
cial tributes; imaginations run 
wide and deep from elegant to 
bizarre and everything in be-
tween! This is truly a one-of-a-
kind event that people will be 
talking about for months. 
   This year our goal is 35 Bras 
and 200+ attendees, giving 
tremendous exposure to all our 
Friend-sponsors. We do hope 
you will join us! If you have 
any questions, please contact 
Sharon at 201-257-5254 or 
Suzanne at 732-241-5177. 

Art Lessons
PERTH AMBOY - Have you 
always dreamed of becoming 
an artist? Well here is your 
chance to learn from one of 
Perth Amboy’s greatest artists. 
People of all ages are welcome 
to join, classes for beginners 
to experienced artists. Come 
check it out at the Picture Gal-
lery, 397 Smith St., Perth Am-
boy.  Contact Robert Roman at 
Cell: 732-977-3203 or at the 
Shop: 732-486-8590.

Prayer To The 

Blessed Virgin
(Never known to fail)

O Most Beautiful Flower of 
Mt. Carmel, Fruitful Vine, 
Splendor of Heaven, Blessed 
Mother of the Son of God, 
Immaculate Virgin, assist me 
in my necessity. O Star of the 
Sea, help me and show me 
herein you are my Mother. O 
Holy Mary, Mother of God,  
Queen of Heaven and Earth, 
I humbly beseech you from 
the bottom of my heart to suc-
cor me in my necessity (make 
request). There are none that 
can withstand your power. O 
Mary conceived without sin, 
pray for us who have recourse 
to thee (3 times). Holy Mary, I 
place this cause in your hands 
(3 times).  M.H.
Say this prayer for 3 consecu-

tive days. You must publish it, 

and it will be granted to you.

Cake and 

Pierogi Sale
PERTH AMOBY - St. John 
the Baptist Orthodox Church 
is having a bake pierogi sale 
on September 24 to September 
28. Pick up your orders at: 404 
Division St., Perth Amboy. 
Please call to place your or-
der: 732-826-7067. Place your 
order between 9 a.m. and 1 
p.m. All Gourmet Items Hand-
made, therefore, call early, be-
fore maximum sales quota is 
reached. Potato pierogi price 
$7. Cake - nut, poppy seed, 
apricot, raspberry and prune 
$10. The order date is Septem-
ber 28 for pierogi and cakes. 
The pick-up date is October 
3rd,4th, & 5th. Thanks for 
your order!

Vegas Trip
PARLIN - come join us on 
Oct. 8 to Oct. 12 on an all 
inclusive trip to Las Vegas. 
Leaving from Knights of Co-
lumbus Council home, Parlin, 
to Newark Liberty Airport for 
a 8:55 a.m. non-stop light 
to Las Vegas. Transported to 
Harrah’s Hotel Casino for 5 
days 4 nights of fun. Coming 
home we catch 3:15 p.m. non-
stop light home. Transported 
by coach back to Knights of 
Columbus Council in Parlin. 
All for $766 per person.  In-
terested? Call Ellie at Main 
Street Travel 732-828-8800 or 
Bill 732-721-5436.
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The Amboy Guardian 

Classiieds Work!

Classiied Ads
Send to P.O. Box 127, Perth Amboy, NJ 08862 

SERVICE DIRECTORY
Call Carolyn @ 732-896-4446

Use this space for 10 words or less to sell your small house-
hold items that are too inexpensive to advertise. The Am-
boy Guardian will print your classiied and help you sell 
those items.  Merchandise must be used and not new items 
for sale items.  Please send one ad per family per week.

FREE CLASSIFIED AD 

FOR ITEMS $75 & UNDER

Tele:

Send to: The Amboy Guardian, P.O. Box 127, Perth Amboy, NJ 08862

(most cars)

Complete Automotive Repairs
Foreign & Domestic

All Repairs 100% Guaranteed
Emission Repair Facility

N.J. State Inspections
272 North Stevens Ave., South Amboy

Oil Change

$24.95

(732)
727-
8500

 FALL  SPECIAL INCLUDES:
• Oil Change
(up to 5 Qts 10W30,
Synthetic Oil Extra)
• Change Oil Filter

• Complete Chassis
Lubrication

JOHN AUTO CENTER, INC.

Auto Repair/Service

Dry Cleaning

KIMBER
DRY CLEANING
732-721-1915

• All Work Done On Premises
• Same Day Cleaning

• Expert Tailoring
& Alterations

106 S. Broadway, South Amboy

R.T. McCRAY ASSOCIATES
               Mediation Consulting

81 Main Street Woodbridge, NJ 07095           
732-855-9177, Facsimile 732-855-9171

website http://www.mccrayassocs.com

Richard T. McCray, JD, PIA, CPM
Court Approved Mediator

Business to Business * Insurance

Employer/Employee * Family Matters

SETTLEMENT BY MEDIATION helps the parties 

facilitate a mediated settlement with less cost and time.
Family Quarrel * Breach of Contract * Less Standard of Customary Care 

Workplace Disputes * Overdue Payments on Book Accounts

Mediation Consulting

For Sale

Catering 

For Sale

Drill Press Cast Iron Multi 
Speed 110V w/stand $50 
732-324-0811              

Twin Bed Frame w/3 
drawers on bottom. Great 
Condition. 862-279-3842

70 Different PEZ dis-
pensors 1970’s -1990’s 
Unique Collection $20 
908-561-9033

Lawnmower 5HP Mur-
ray Push No Bag 21” $75 
908-964-3586

Treadmill $40 - no incline 
- must pick up (folds up) 
732-331-8243

150 John Wayne Films 
with wood Cabinet $75 
732-826-1872

BMW Mag Rims $25 
Each Call Leave Message 
732-442-4624

For Sale Boxing Station-
ary Bag. Everlast. Paid 
$200 Asking $50 732-
471-6491
                       
Excellent 4 Piece Design-
er Luggage Green wheels 
asking $40 732-238-8439           

CD’s Spanish various art-
ists 40 at $75 all 732-855-
6898                              x

Free for the taking - sofa 
and matching love seat 
732-727-8417

Two mink fur women’s 
shawls - excellent condi-
tion - classic $60- 908-
561-9033  
  
Kids Table & Chairs $25 
Grandma Clock $25 2-5 
Drawer Chests $30 732-
809-5377

Playstation 2, Multitop 
Memory Card and game 
$50 732-316-1042    

Looney Tunes Wall Unit 
Free, Websters Mini Li-
brary set of 7 $6/set - 732-
535-8142   

Graveside Care

Business Route

Route for Sale. Bakery 
products, 4 days, some 
inance available. Seri-
ous calls only! Asking 
$55,000 908-337-9881   
10/10

Your Ad Can 
Go Here for 

$10 

a week
10 Week 

Minimum

Required

Your Ad Here

Apartment for Rent

Perth Amboy - 1st loor, 
2 bedrooms, $1050/mo, 
utilites extra call 732-874-
4429

Drain Cleaning Services

A-DEPENDABLE DRAIN 
& SEWER CLEANING SERVICES

Drains Electrically Snaked Out!
Sewer, Kitchen Sinks & Bathroom Basins

Laundry Tubs, Storm Drains to Curbs
All Work Guaranteed

Summer Special 

$75 - $95 - 

Mon - Sat - Day Rates 

(Residential)
Nights & Sundays Extra

732-442-1836      
732-583-0591
732-382-2220

Drum Lessons

Drum Lessons - Begin-
ner to Advanced - all age 
levels & styles - 732-283-
0838                               10/17

Apartment for Rent

ZPA BAR AND GRILL
Now Serving Lunches from 11 a.m.

Our Chef Will Delight You 

With A Variety of Foods

Cold Beer and Drinks

Happy Hour Mon – Fri 11 a.m.–5 p.m.
281 Grace St., Perth Amboy, NJ  

732-442-2660
www.ZPAbanquethallsnj.com

Banquet and Catering Facilities

Room  for Rent
Single Person only - no 
overnite, guest -  cable, 
utilities included. Private 
5 bed 2 bath home 732-
566-2945                9/26

Perth Amboy - Large 
1 bedroom apt. for 
rent. Incl. All appli-
ances and W/D $985/
mo plus utilites 732-
921-0006       9/26   

Catering & Hall Avail-
able 30 years experience. 
Woodbridge/Edison area. 
732-983-1013 10/17

Landscaping
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FOR MORE OF OUR FEATURED LISTINGS, PLEASE GO TO OUR WEBSITE:
WWW.PETRABESTREALTY.COM

YOU HAVE OPTIONS! 
LET PETRA BEST REALTY 

FIND THE RIGHT SOLUTION FOR YOU!

AVOID FORECLOSURE!
CONSULT A SHORT SALE EXPERT. CALL TODAY! 

LET OUR EXPERTS HELP YOU THROUGH 
THE PROCESS OF SELLING YOUR PROPERTY!

IN THIS CHANGING MARKET,
HOW MANY TIMES HAVE YOU WONDERED

HOW MUCH YOUR PROPERTY IS WORTH?

CALL FOR FREE MARKET ANALYSIS!

Dedication, Vision and Results!

329 SMITH STREET • PERTH AMBOY
(732) 442-1400 • (732) 442-1480 fax

The Real Estate Team With

PERTH AMBOY - Wow, great charm & character 
abound in this home! Enjoy serene water views and lazy 
park promenades form this immaculate & spacious Wa-
terfront 5 bdrm home. Restored to its original glory. It ftrs 
new ktchn, corian ctrtps, wd-brng frplce, 2.5 baths, new rf, 
hdwd, trex-dex & much more. Not one to miss! Motivated 
seller! $219,900

PERTH AMBOY - Grocery store on 1st level is leased 
for $1,260 with a 5% increase per year. 2 yr remains with 
5 yr option. 2nd l. apartment is rented for $1,400. Mo 
to Mo. owner pays for water, sewer and heat. Approx. 
$4,200 annually. Buyer is resp. for code compliance, Ter-
mite Cert. and all repairs. Short Sale. $189,000

PERTH AMBOY - Delightful and charming house at 
the desirable Holy Spirit Section, completely upgraded. A 
beautiful backyard with a big gazebo, swimming pool and 
sprinkler system in the rear and front. $359,000

PERTH AMBOY - Great investment property. Desirable 
area near waterfront are. (5) apartments fully rented. 3-3 
bedroom apts. & 2-1 beddroom apts. Close to shops and 
public transportation. Seller to obtain C/O. This is not a 
short sale. $475,000

PERTH AMBOY - Great potential close to public trans-
portation and all major highways. Buyer is resp. for C/O, 
Termite Cert, and all repairs. This is being sold strictly in 
“as is” condition. Only Cash, or FHA 203K.  $159,000

PERTH AMBOY - Check out this great 5 yr old home. 
Better than new. Nice layout. Great neighborhood. Gran-
ite, stainless steel appliances. Master bedroom has an 
En-suite. Looking for a townhome/condo; this is even 
better...NO MAINTENANCE FEES!!! A MUST SEE!!!  
$262,000

PERTH AMBOY - Great starter home. “Move-in” condi-
tion. Former two car garage now being used as storage. 
Finished basement and much more. See MLS #1301287  
$90,900

FORDS - “Move-in” condition  - lots of upgrades. Gran-
ite counter tops, hardwood loors and a lot more. A “must 
see.” Buyer is resp. for Smoke Cert., Termite Cert. and all 
repairs. Short Sale. $219,000

PERTH AMBOY - Investors dream. All separate utili-
ties. 6 apartments fully rented. 5-1 bedrooms & 1-2 
bedrooms. This is not a short sale. Seller to obtain C/O. 
$375,000

INOSENCIO “MANNY” PENA  

Sales Associate

Congratulations to 

Inosencio “Manny” 

Pena for being the 

#1 Agent for the 

Month of August


