
July 27, 2016 * The Amboy Guardian  .1

National Night Out Tuesday, August 2, 2016

Amboy   Guardian
THE *Weekly Newspaper*

• VOL. 6  NO. 17 • 732-896-4446  • P.O. BOX 127 • PERTH AMBOY • NJ • 08862 • WEDNESDAY, JULY 27, 2016 •

 * WWW.AMBOYGUARDIAN.COM *

COMPLIMENTARY
UP TO 10 COPIES/$1 EACH ADDITIONAL

*Continued on Page 9

Christine Dispenziere, Maria Vera and Maria Garcia at the 
7/13/16 Council Meeting          *Photo by Carolyn Maxwell

Municipal Board Members’ Terms Questioned
7/11/16 Caucus & 7/13/16 Council Meetings

PERTH AMBOY - At the 
7/11/16 Caucus Meeting Law 
Director Arlene Quinones-Per-
ez gave a brief explanation of 
why the Planning Board Mem-
bers’ terms can’t be extended 
like other Municipal Boards. 
She explained that former Law 
Director Mark Blunda may 
have extended other Municipal 
Board Members’ terms when 
the Council’s and Mayor’s 
terms were extended (in 2012).
   Quinones made that state-
ment after Council President 
Lisa Nanton stated that the 
state stature gives the power 
to extend the Planning Board 
Members’ terms. Quinones 
ended the discussion by say-
ing, “I will see what other mu-
nicipalities did. It all depends 
on the classifications that other 
Boards are under.”
   At the 7/13/16 Council Meet-
ing, Christine Dispenziere, 
Planning Board Vice-Chair 
voiced her displeasure that 
two Board Members that each 
had 8+ years on the Planning 
Board were not reappointed. 
She then read an ordinance per-
taining to terms of Municipal 
Boards. She urged the Council 
to investigate as to why these 
two Members were not reap-

pointed. “These two individu-
als were very passionate, ac-
curate and thorough and went 
to all the training courses. The 
Mayor asked for legal counsel 
from our Planning Board At-
torney which was taken out of 
the Planning Board’s budget.”
   Resident Stanley Siera-
kowski told the Council, 
“You have a recourse. Go to 
Superior Court about the or-
dinance pertaining to Munici-
pal Board Member terms.” 
   Maria Garcia, who is one of 
the Planning Board Members 
whose is not being reappoint-
ed to another term came up to 
speak. She mentioned a let-

ter that she received from the 
Business Administrator Adam 
Cruz. “In the letter it said 
that people were complaining 
about some of my postings that 
I put up on Facebook.”
   Garcia questioned, “What 
postings did I have on my 
Facebook Page that the Busi-
ness Administrator said people 
complained about? The Mayor 
failed to reappoint us for one 
year. Some of the decisions 
that were made during that 
time could be invalid.” (See 
Statement by Maria Garcia 
p.4.) Councilman Joel Pabon 
was absent at the 7/11/16 Cau-
cus.

I Want This Project Done
7/13/16 Council Meeting

PERTH AMBOY - R-329-
7/16 - Rescinding R-296-6/16 
Authorizing a construction li-
cense agreement between the 
City of Perth Amboy and Perth 
Amboy Self Storage, LLC.
   During the first public portion, 
Resident Stanley Sierakowski 
had plenty to say about Reso-
lution R-329. “This property 
(on the industrial part of outer 
High Street ) is leased with an 
option to buy. This property is 
6000 cubic yards of soil. Find 
what a comparable company 
will pay for a property this 
size. You (the Council) should 
conduct your own testing. This 
company has a million dollar 
insurance policy (on this land). 
There should be at least a $5 
million policy. Even clay can 
be unstable. There should be 
two appraisals made.”
   Resident Ken Balut wanted 
to know “What City Lawyer 
negotiated this? There is no 
bonding to protect us.”
   Resident David Caba said, 
“There were some concerns 
at a previous Council Meet-
ing when the attorney from 
the other side was here an-
swering Councilman Petrick’s 
questions. Our attorney was 
not looking out for the City’s 
interest. What can you (the 
Council) do to have our attor-
ney removed? She made the 
other attorney’s job easier.”
   Council President Lisa Nan-
ton responded to Caba’s ques-
tion, “Yes, we can have her 

removed, but we haven’t been 
discussing that.”
   When Resident Alan Silber 
came up to speak on Resolu-
tion R-329; he went even fur-
ther, “At a previous meeting 
the lawyer from the developer 
(who is leasing this property) 
was here. Our Law Director 
(Quinones-Perez) said, “The 
Developer’s lawyer can sue 
the City for libel.” You (the 
Council) should contact the 
Hispanic Lawyers of New Jer-
sey, the DeCotiis Law Firm 
and Billy Delgado about this 
(telling the opposing lawyer 
what options they have). There 
is no guarantee. Buy the prop-
erty now. You’re not charging 
a lot of money. You need a fair 
price.”
   Councilmen William Pet-
rick and Fernando Gonzalez 
had differences of opinion on 
how this resolution should 
be handled. Councilman Fer-
nando Gonzalez’ main con-
cern was that is the land in 
question has been vacant for 
a very long time and has been 
an eyesore. Councilman Wil-
liam Petrick said, “We should 
pass this resolution R-329 and 
rescind the first one.” Petrick 
also wanted to know, “Who 
reviewed this contract?” 
   Law Director Arlene Qui-
nones-Perez responded, “I re-
viewed the form and the lan-
guage in the contract.”

Councilman 
Bill Petrick

Councilman 
Fernando Gonzalez

School Bus Parking Persists
7/13/16 Council Meeting

PERTH AMBOY - Resident 
Maria Vera questioned why 
our historic train station is 
being used for school buses 
and vans to park. “There was 
a person found defecating be-
tween two buses. Those buses 
should be in a private fenced-
in property. Our town looks 
ghetto. Use the old Police Sta-
tion and the Steel Mill proper-
ties for parking. Nobody else 
has school buses parked in 
the train stations. Is it worth 
having someone run over by 
a bus? People don’t have any 
parking in the downtown as it 

is.”
   After Vera spoke, Coun-
cilman Fernando Gonzalez 
agreed with her statement 
about using the old steel mill 
property on Elm Street as a 
place for these buses to park. 
“I know a lot of people who 
drive these buses feed their 
families by doing so. The tax 
assessor can give the owners 
of these busses a list of vacant 
properties.”
   Business Administrator 
Adam Cruz gave an explana-
tion as to why the old Police 
Department property cannot 

be used. “There’s no electric-
ity for lighting for the buses 
to park at night. It will take 
months and a lot of invest-
ments to make this happen.”
   Councilman Joel Pabon then 
brought up property on Sayre 
Avenue that could be used.
   Council President Lisa Nan-
ton said, “We should empha-
size to this bus company that 
they need to look at other 
properties to park their vans 
and buses than the train sta-
tion.”
   (See Page 11 for Photos)
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NOW REGISTERING
PRE-K (4 YR OLD) KINDERGARTEN, GRADES 1 - 8

Assumption
Catholic School

Meredith and Jacques Streets
Perth Amboy

AdvanceED Accredited

NOW REGISTERING FOR 2016 - 2017

732-826-8721
ACSSCHOOLOFFICE@GMAIL.COM

WWW.ASSUMPTIONCATHOLICSCHOOL.NET

If It’s Local - It’s Here! Universal 
Training 
Institute

Register Now to Become a 
Licensed Practical Nurse

Or Certified Nursing 
Assistant

Open House
July 30, 2016

9 a.m. – 2 p.m.

LPN Classes 
Start September 12, 2016 

Day & Evening
CNA Classes 

Start July 18, 2016

174 Jefferson St., 2nd Floor
Perth Amboy, NJ 08861

732-826-0155
www.universaluti.com
“Stop Dreaming and 

Start Doing”
ENROLLING NOW!!

FINANCIAL AID 
AVAILABLE FOR 

THOSE WHO QUALIFY

Attend Public Meetings 
Have Your Voice Heard!

It’s a Bicycle 
Rodeo!

PERTH AMBOY - Join us on 
Saturday, July 30th from 12 
p.m. - 4 p.m. for a fun filled 
day on Westside Ave and Dill-
man Lane, in Perth Amboy, for 
ages 5 and up to practice and 
develop skills that will help 
them to become better bicy-
clists and avoid typical crash-
es. The goal is to teach chil-
dren the skills and precautions 
to ride a bicycle safely.  Food, 
music, giveaways, helmet 
decorating, bicycle license and 
registration will be provided. 
In partnership with the Jew-
ish Renaissance Foundation 
and the Perth Amboy Police 
Dept. Have a bicycle to do-
nate?  Contact Vanessa Cepin 
at (732) 324-2114 x114.

A Call to a 
Higher 

Dimension
CARTERET/PERTH AM-
BOY – The Redeemed Chris-
tian Church God Sanctuary 
of Praise is having its 17th 
Anniversary Celebration. The 
theme: A Call to a Higher 
Dimension. Activities and 
Events: Anniversary Picnic at 
Joseph Medwick Park, Cart-
eret on Saturday, July 30, 
2016 at 11 a.m.; Anniversary 
Celebration Services at SOP 
on Sunday, July 31, 2016 at 
3 p.m.; Ministering Pastor 
Daniel Ajayi-Adeniran; Ven-
ue: 489 Amboy Ave., Perth 
Amboy. RSVP Mr. Gbenga 
Qgunyemi (908-249-2717)/
Mr. Adekunle Joel (732-277-
1519)/Sis Moremi Onafowora 
(732-207-7579)/Sis Busirat 
Otun (732-616-7375).
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Naturalization Ceremony, Proprietary House, Perth Amboy 7/18/16
*Photos by Paul W. Wang

Pallone Delivers 
Keynote Address 

at Special 
Naturalization 
Ceremony in 
Perth Amboy

Press Release 
PERTH AMBOY – On Monday, 
July 18 at 10 a.m. Congressman 
Frank Pallone, Jr. (NJ-06) deliv-
ered the keynote address to 20 
new American citizens and their 
guests during a special naturaliza-
tion ceremony at the Perth Am-
boy Proprietary House. Council 
President Lisa Nanton will lead 
the Pledge of Allegiance and Perth 
Amboy Mayor Wilda Diaz will 
deliver the opening remarks. US-
CIS Newark Field Office Director 
Randi Borgen will be administer-
ing the oath.
   The 20 citizenship candidates 
originate from the following 8 
countries: Dominican Republic, 
India, Syria, Bulgaria, Colombia, 
Germany, Pakistan, and Sri Lanka.

WWW.AMBOYGUARDIAN.COM
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Catching Up Statement by 
Maria Gar-

cia Read at the 
7/13/16 Council 

Meeting
   I am here today to present the 
current situation of the Plan-
ning Board. I was appointed 
by the Mayor to the planning 
Board in July 17, 2008 as a 
class 4 member, since that time 
I have served our city as a vol-
unteer and I have tried to do 
the best for the community.
For the past 7 years I was 
voted by a majority to be the 
chairperson of the planning 
board and at no time I heard 
any complaints from the May-
or about my tenure or my abili-
ties as a chairwoman. I can 
attest to the fact that in more 
than one occasion I had to stop 
the Mayor from meddling in 
the business of the Board as I 
took my job of been impartial 
very seriously.
   During my tenure on a yearly 
basis I have devoted hours of 
my personal time to the busi-
ness of the Board as well to 
develop my knowledge by at-
tending the classes offered by 
the League of municipalities to 
expand my knowledge of the 
land used law in order for me 
to make informed legal deci-
sions when they have come in 
front of the Board.
   Last month I received a letter 
from the Business Administra-
tor accusing me of not behav-
ing in an appropriated manner 
as the chair of the planning 
board the Mayor was con-
cerned with how my behavior 
was damaging the Image of the 
city. The curious thing about 
this letter was that there was no 
specifics or proof of anything 
that I did wrong. I contacted 
the BA and after 3 phone calls 
to ask him for an explanation, 
finally he told me that “people 
had filed complaints about me 
because of something I posted 
on my personal Facebook ac-
count.” I was in shocked by 
his response and I reminded 
him that I am not an employee 
of the city; I have freedom of 
speech; I never signed any pa-
pers with the city giving up my 
right of free speech and that 
nothing I post in Facebook is 
derogatory. I also stated that I 
feel insulted and I asked him 
to send me the proof of what 
he claimed I have posted via 
E-mail. He told me he couldn’t 
and that he will send it to me 

via certified mail...I specifi-
cally asked him to send it to 
me no later than Tuesday of 
the following week. The letter 
was never sent. I also request-
ed OPRA to find out how many 
complaints people had against 
me and all documents I have 
signed to be part of the Board... 
There was no complaints and 
there were no documents that 
I have signed giving my rights 
of free speech or participating 
on Facebook.
   Two weeks after this inci-
dent I received a letter from 
the Mayor saying that she was 
not reappointing me and an-
other member to the Planning 
Board. I respect her decision 
but, I do not agree with her 
actions. I am questioning why 
would she get rid of the most 
qualified members of the Plan-
ning Board at this time? Why 
for the past 3 years she has 
been implementing an ordi-
nance that she signed in 2013 
extending the appointments of 
all members of the Boards by 
6 months but today she ignores 
the ordinance she signed? 
   I contacted different people 
about this matter and low and 
behold I also found out that 
the Mayor and the City At-
torney without the permission 
of the Chair or Vice Chair of 
the Planning Board used the 
Planning Board Attorney as 
counsel. The Planning Board 
Attorney stated that no class 4 
member can serve more than 4 
years. I called him and asked 
him to clarify and he told me 
that State stature only allows 
members to serve for 4 years 
after that time they must be re-
appointed and if their tenure is 
more than 4 years without re-
appointment all the decisions 
which they voted on can be 
challenged. 
   I decided to investigate this 
law myself and also to con-
sult with other Attorneys. 
What the State stature says is 
that the term of a member is 
4 years but, it also specifies 
under clause C -. In any mu-
nicipality in which the term of 
the municipal governing body 
commences on January 1, the 
governing body may, by ordi-
nance, provide that the term 
of appointment of any class of 
member of the planning board 
appointed pursuant to this sec-
tion shall commence on Janu-
ary 1. In any municipality in 
which the term of the munici-
pal governing body commenc-
es on July 1, the governing 
body may, by ordinance, pro-

vide that the term of appoint-
ment of any class of member 
appointed pursuant to this sec-
tion commence on July 1.
   Once again I must remind 
all of you that the Mayor did 
sign an ordinance to extend all 
her board appointments for six 
months and that she has been 
doing that for the past 3 years. 
Another thing that I found out 
was that the Mayor failed to 
reappoint many members of 
the Boards for years includ-
ing myself and Kurt Rebovich. 
She failed to reappoint us for 
an entire year in 06/30/2011 
she did not take action until 
05/31/12 therefore, for an en-
tire year any decisions that we 
have made can be challenge 
due to her incompetence and 
carelessness.
   Today the Mayor of this city 
is showing her lack of good 
judgment where for political 
reasons because I chose not to 
support her for Mayor this year 
she is retaliating and is not tak-
ing into consideration the harm 
that she is doing to our com-
munity by getting rid of 2 of 
the most qualified members 
of the Planning Board; due to 
her actions the Planning Board 
will be affected and many proj-
ects will be in the hands of un-
qualified new members who 
she will appoint and who she 
can control.
   In conclusion this Mayor is 
not representing the people she 
is representing herself and her 
agenda. This Mayor has turned 
just to what we had before a ty-
rannical vindictive Mayor that 
will do anything even violate 
her own laws to get back at 
those that disagree with her. I 
want all citizens to think of one 
thing when they go to vote this 
November...
   Why is it that all the people 
who supported Mayor Wilda 
Diaz from the beginning are 
not supporting her today?
   Lastly, I am proud to have 
served the community as the 
Chair of the Planning Board 
for the past 8 years. My inter-
est has been nothing but to do 
the best for our city, it hasn’t 
been easy but, I always tried to 
do the best for the community. 
I wish all remaining members 
the best and hopefully they 
keep in mind they are indepen-
dent and should only look for 
the best for our town not the 
political agendas of the Mayor.

Maria Garcia

   I have been meaning to address 
3 issues that have been put on the 
back-burner.
Community Cleanups: At one 
of the Council Meetings, a Resi-
dent mentioned that when he was 
growing up, Residents were re-
sponsible for cleaning their own 
properties. 
   With the City periodically hav-
ing City-Wide Cleanups, to me it 
makes the residents more compla-
cent and say,”Why even bother to 
clean up when the City will do it 
for you.”
   Educational programs are tak-
ing place in the schools to have 
students develop good habits to 
use trash receptacles to dispose 
of their garbage. They’re hoping 
that the kids will pass this onto 
their parents. 
   I find that it’s the adults that 
are the worst offenders. There 
are still some people who will 
still throw their fast food contain-
ers from their vehicles on to the 
ground in the parking lots when 
they are done eating. , I’ve seen 
this done even though there is a 
garbage can close by.
   More garbage cans are needed, 
especially between Maple Street 
and Elm Street and Smith Street. 
McClellan Street needs a garbage 
can, too. There is often garbage 
all over the parking lot there.
   It’s very good to have garbage 
cans for both recyclables and for 
trash, but people if they use them, 
don’t differentiate when they 
throw the trash. I guess we should 
be grateful they are using recep-
tacles instead of throwing their 
garbage on the street.
Pedestrian Cross Walks: The 
Police Department is handing 
out laminated warnings explain-
ing the new Pedestrian Safety 
Laws where they not only ticket 
drivers, but pedestrians as well. I 
don’t know how they are going to 
enforce the pedestrian summons.
   The Police Department has been 
awarded grants to teach residents 
about pedestrian safety. Some of 
them are geared towards teaching 
school children the importance 
of crossing the street safely. This 
has been done through the distri-
bution of flyers and other printed 
materials in schools. 
   I remember about 8 years ago, 
in Fink Park, they actually had 
representatives of the Department 
of Transportation distribute litera-
ture that was placed on tables and 
also in colorful, large bags. They 
also had representatives from the 

Perth Amboy Police Traffic Divi-
sion involved. 
   In spite of these efforts, I find 
that pedestrians are more brazen 
than ever. If I were driver, I defi-
nitely would have a dash-cam  to 
show the pedestrians who cross 
the street in front of cars who 
have the green light. It’s almost if 
these pedestrians are challenging 
the cars to go ahead and hit me.
   According to literature that I 
obtained, pedestrians caught do-
ing so would get a warning the 
first time, then a $54 fine for the 
second infraction. My question is, 
“At what age group do you start 
fining people and what ID will 
they have to produce? What  hap-
pens if they don’t have any ID on 
them or they refuse to show it? I 
think that the Council should re-
quest that the Police Department 
have a presentation of how they 
are going to enforce these pedes-
trian laws?
Handicapped Parking Commit-
tee: This one I’m still scratch-
ing my head over. This commit-
tee was formed after City Clerk 
Elaine Jasko told the City Council 
that she and members of different 
City Departments were not com-
fortable determining which ap-
plicants who wanted handicapped 
placards/spaces should be issued 
one. After much tossing and turn-
ing, it was decided that perhaps 
it would be best the City should 
not make this determination. It 
was advertised on the City’s web-
site that any residents who were 
interested in serving on a Handi-
capped Parking Committee to fill 
out an application. There are 3 
residents who were selected to be 
on this committee. 
   At the last Council Meeting, 
one of the Council Members 
asked what was the status of the 
committee. As of yet, this com-
mittee has not had a meeting to 
view any requested handicapped 
applications. City Clerk Jasko 
answered that a lot of the appli-
cants did not complete all the re-
quired questions on the form and 
their forms were returned back to 
them. Why have a committee of 
laymen formed when the applica-
tions are going to be pre-screened 
anyway? To me, common sense 
would be to just let the DMV at 
the applicants physician make 
this decision. All the police need 
to do is to determine whether or 
not the space will be a safety is-
sue. This committee is not need-
ed. C.M.
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Largest Summer Business Meet N’ Greet 
Networking at the Barge, 

201 Front St., Perth Amboy, NJ
Thursday August 18 @ 5:30 p.m.-7:30 p.m.
For more info call Milton @732-306-0040

Find out what all the buzz is about!

Attention! Our Newspaper is available at Shop-
Rite, Perth Amboy at the Courtesy Counter! 

IN FORDS:
COLONIAL RESTAURANT..................................... 366 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
LIBERTY BAGEL CAFE.......................................... 326 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
PUBLIC LIBRARY............................................................................211 FORD AVE.
ROOSEVELT’S DELI ....................................................684 KING GEORGE’S RD.
SUPER DUPER DELI III .............................................. 650 KING GEORGE’S RD.
IN HOPELAWN:
KRAUSZER’S................................................................683 FLORIDA GROVE RD.
IN LAURENCE HARBOR:
HOFFMAN’S DELI ............................................................... 5 LAURENCE PKWY.
IN MORGAN:
SOUTHPINE LIQUORS .................................................................467 S. PINE AVE.
IN PARLIN:
DAD’S ROYAL BAKERY..................................................3290 WASHINGTON RD.
IN PERTH AMBOY:
1ST CONSTITUTION BANK ......................................................... 145 FAYETTE ST.
ADULT CONTINUING EDUCATION CENTER .................... 178 BARRACKS ST.
ALAMEDA CENTER ............................................................................ 303 ELM ST.
AMBOY CHECK X-CHANGE .........................................................321 MAPLE ST.
AMBOY EYE CARE ............................................................................94 SMITH ST.
ANITA’S CORNER .........................................................................664 BRACE AVE.
ASIAN CAFE.........................................................................................271 KING ST. 
THE BARGE .......................................................................................201 FRONT ST.
C-TOWN .............................................................................................272 MAPLE ST.
CEDENO’S PHARMACY ................................................................... 400 STATE ST.
CITY HALL ............................................................................................260 HIGH ST.
COPA DE ORO .................................................................................... 306 SMITH ST.
DUNKIN DONUTS ........................................................................ 587 FAYETTE ST.
EASTSIDE DRY CLEANERS .............................................................. 87 SMITH ST.
ELIZABETH CORNER ..................................................................... 175 HALL AVE.
FAMILY FOOT CARE ........................................................................252 SMITH ST.
FU LIN ................................................................................................... 79 SMITH ST.
HY TAVERN .......................................................................................... 386 HIGH ST.
INVESTOR’S BANK ........................................................................... 598 STATE ST.
JANKOWSKI COMMUNITY CENTER ................................................ 1 OLIVE ST.
JEWISH RENAISSANCE MEDICAL CENTER ......................... 272A HOBART ST.
KIM’S DRY CLEANERS ...................................................................... 73 SMITH ST.
LAW OFFICES ............................................................................. 708 CARSON AVE.
LEE’S MARKET .................................................................................. 77 SMITH ST.
LUDWIG’S PHARMACY .................................................................75 BRACE AVE.
MITRUSKA CHIROPRACTIC ...............................................788 CONVERY BLVD.
PETRA BEST REALTY....................................................................... 329 SMITH ST.
PETRICK’S FLOWERS .......................................................... 710 PFEIFFER BLVD.
POLICE HEADQUARTERS ...................................... 365 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
PORTUGUESE MANOR ........................................................................ 310 ELM ST.
PROVIDENT BANK ........................................................................... 339 STATE ST.
PUBLIC LIBRARY .....................................................................196 JEFFERSON ST.
PUERTO RICAN ASSOCIATION ........................................................100 FIRST ST.
QUICK CHEK .........................................................................853 CONVERY BLVD.
QUICK STOP DELI .......................................................................814 AMBOY AVE.
QUISQUEYA MARKET .........................................................249 MADISON AVE.
QUISQUEYA LUNCHEONETTE ............................................ 259 MADISON AVE.
RARITAN BAY AREA Y.M.C.A. ................................365 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
RARITAN BAY MEDICAL CENTER ........................530 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
SANTANDER BANK ............................................................. 365 CONVERY BLVD.
SANTIBANA TRAVEL ....................................................................... 362 STATE ST.
SCIORTINO’S RESTAURANT .................................473 NEW BRUNSWICK AVE.
SHOP-RITE .............................................................................365 CONVERY BLVD.
SIPOS BAKERY ................................................................................. 365 SMITH ST.
SUPERIOR DINER..............................................................................464 SMITH ST.
SUPREMO SUPERMARKET ...............................................................270 KING ST.
TORRES MINI MARKET ..............................................................403 BRUCK AVE.
TOWN DRUGS & SURGICAL ......................................................... 238 SMITH ST.
WELLS FARGO .................................................................................. 214 SMITH ST.
ZPA ...................................................................................................... 281 GRACE ST.
IN SAYREVILLE:
BOROUGH HALL ................................................................................ 167 MAIN ST.
SENIOR CENTER ................................................................................ 423 MAIN ST.
SUNNYSIDE RESTAURANT .............................................................. 111 MAIN ST.
IN SEWAREN:
PUBLIC LIBRARY .............................................................................546 WEST AVE.
SEWAREN CORNER DELI ...............................................................514 WEST AVE.
IN SOUTH AMBOY:
AMBOY NATIONAL BANK ......................................................100 N. BROADWAY
BROADWAY BAGELS ...............................................................105 S. BROADWAY
BROADWAY DINER ..	................................................................126 N. BROADWAY 
CITY HALL .................................................................................140 N. BROADWAY
COMMUNITY CENTER ......................................................... 200 O’LEARY BLVD.
KRAUSZER’S .............................................................................200 N. BROADWAY
KRAUSZER’S ...................................................................717 BORDENTOWN AVE.
PUBLIC LIBRARY ...............................................................100 HOFFMAN PLAZA 
SCIORTINO’S HARBOR LIGHTS	........................................... 132 S. BROADWAY
SOUTH AMBOY MEDICAL CENTER............................540 BORDENTOWN AVE.
WELLS FARGO BANK..............................................................116 N. BROADWAY
IN WOODBRIDGE:
CITY HALL ...............................................................................................1 MAIN ST.
MAIN ST. FARM ...................................................................................107 MAIN ST.
NEWS & TREATS .................................................................................. 99 MAIN ST.
REO DINER ....................................................................................392 AMBOY AVE.
ST. JOSEPH’S SENIORS RESIDENCE ................................1 ST. JOSEPH’S TERR.

Where to Find Us . . . 

Community Calendar
Perth Amboy 	 	
TUES. Aug. 2	 PARA, 6 p.m.
			   City Hall, High St.
WED. Aug. 3	 Planning Board, 7 p.m.
			   City Hall, High St.
MON. Aug. 8	 City Council, Caucus 4:30 p.m.
			   City Hall, High St.
TUES. Aug. 9	 BID, 4 p.m.
			   City Hall, High St.
	 •	 Library Board of Trustees, 5 p.m. 
			   Library, Jefferson St.
WED. Aug. 10 	 City Council, Regular, 7 p.m.
			   City Hall, High St.
South Amboy
WED. Aug. 3	 City Council, Business, 6 p.m.
			   City Hall, N. Broadway
WED. Aug. 17	 City Council, Regular, 7 p.m.
			   City Hall, N. Broadway

Kearny 
Cottage Open

PERTH AMBOY - Come visit 
the historic home of Commo-
dore Lawrence Kearny. The 
Cottage is located at 63 Ca-
talpa Ave, Perth Amboy, and is 
open on Mondays and Thurs-
days from 2 p.m. - 4 p.m. and 
the last Sunday of the month 
from 2 p.m. - 4 p.m. by ap-
pointment. The Kearny Cot-
tage needs your help.  Anyone 
interested in joining the Kear-
ny Cottage Historical Society 
please contact 732-293-1090.  
We are on the web!   www.Ke-
arnyCottage.org

Volunteer 
Firefighters 

Needed
PERTH AMBOY - The Perth 
Amboy Fire Department: 
Volunteer Division needs 
members. Accepting men and 
women ages 18 years or older.  
Volunteers must be a Perth 
Amboy resident.  For more in-
formation please contact 732-
442-3430.

Deadline for Print Ads: 
7 p.m. Thursday

Office Hours: 
Mon. - Wed. 9 a.m. - 5 p.m. 

Thurs. 10 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Fri. 9 a.m. - 3 p.m.

Proprietary 
House Open

PERTH AMBOY - The Pro-
prietary House, the last of-
ficial Royal Governor’s resi-
dence still standing in the 
original 13 colonies, is open 
every Wednesday from 1:00 
p.m. to 4:00 p.m., for tea and 
tours.  Tea  is served in our at-
mospheric candle-lit wine cel-
lar, and includes our delicious 
homemade desserts and assort-
ed teas. A $10 donation, $5 for 
children under 12, covers both 
the tea and a mansion. 
   Although the house is still in 
the process of being restored, 
some rooms have been newly 
decorated. Go back in time and 
learn about William Frank-
lin and other residents of the 
house. It’s a perfect way to 
spend a pleasant afternoon. 
The gift shop is also open.
   Groups are welcome, al-
though reservations are re-
quired for groups over six 
people. The Proprietary House 
is located at 149 Kearny Ave., 
Perth Amboy, NJ. Tel. 732-
826-5527 E-mail: info@pro-
prietaryhouse.org. Follow us 
on our website, www.thepro-
prietaryhouse.org and or/Face-
book. 

Attend Public Meetings 
Have Your Voice Heard!

Correction
PERTH AMBOY — In the 
7/20/16 issue of the Amboy 
Guardian, in the Editorial on  
Page 4 Lisa Nanton was incor-
rectly identified as President 
of the Royal Garden Club. It 
was brought to our attention 
that Betty Crews has been the 
President of the Royal Garden 
Club since 2013. 
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Red Grant Regatta, Raritan Yacht Club, Perth Amboy, 7/9/16 & 7/10/16
*Photos by Paul W. Wang & Carolyn Maxwell

Raritan Yacht Club Dedicates 70th Red Grant Regatta as Fundraiser For United States Coast Guard Foundation
Press Release July 1, 2016
PERTH AMBOY – The Red Grant Regatta, held annually in Perth Amboy, has been one of the highpoints of competitive sailing in the New York New Jersey area for 70 years. This year, the Red 
Grant Regatta occurred on July 8-10, 2016 and once again the Club sponsored a fundraiser during the regatta. 
   In addition to yachting races, the Regatta highlighted fundraising for the United States Coast Guard Foundation throughout the weekend.  The Coast Guard Foundation is committed to supporting 
the men and women of the United States Coast Guard by providing college scholarships to enlisted members, their spouses and their children, as well as scholarships and support for families of Coast 
Guard members lost in the line of duty. The Foundation also supports recreation, exercise and family-oriented facilities 
   The Red Grant Regatta began to honor Adolph “Red” Grant, a Perth Amboy yacht racer and veteran who lost his life in World War II at a very young age. This annual event is a major part of Raritan 
Yacht Club’s 150-year history in Perth Amboy. The regatta has grown to become one of the premier regattas in the Metropolitan area.
   The 100 plus boats expected to compete in the sailboat racing July 9-10 on Raritan Bay, travel from New York, southern New Jersey and other yacht clubs on the bay to attend this prestigious 
event. Friday events include junior sailing and will highlight small sailboats and approximately 75 junior competitor sailors.  On 9/816 & 9/10/16, the large PHRF boats and one-design boats raced.  
Saturday is also the day when the Mayor’s Cup race for cruising sailboats will take place. The Mayor’s Cup race has become a very popular event and a highlight of the regatta weekend. Mayor Diaz 
will be on hand to present the award.  The Red Grant Regatta is open to all sailors who are current members of US Sailing. Information is available on the yacht club website: www.ryc.org. For a list 
of the winners go to www.yachtscoring.com/
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ERALIDES E. CABRERA
Counselor At Law

                        Specializing In    
• Immigration
• Bankruptcy

Offices Located At:
708 Carson Ave., Perth Amboy, NJ 08861 

 Phone: 732 - 826-5020; Fax: 732-826-6646
1201 E. Grand St., Unit 3A, Elizabeth, NJ 07201 

Phone: 908-351-0957; Fax: 908-351-0959

Inspired by the Tree(s?)

They cut down another tree today
Agencies and agents, bloated and unthinking
Government heroes, DPW this time,
Protecting us from the branches, nongovernmental.
Tearing down that which their grandfathers sowed 
Eight with extended power saws and shredders
Conservation of energy notwithstanding.
Destruction is so much simpler than maintenance
That takes work besides
They have the tools and they think they have 
The right.
Along they waved me
Exasperated at my hesitancy
To follow instruction
After all, they’re only following orders.

Robert Book, Son of Peter, a.k.a. Pedro Libro

Connections Program Seeks Volunteers
MIDDLESEX COUNTY - The Connections Program of Catholic Charities, Diocese of Metuchen, a voluntary child to adult match program is seeking adult volunteers to provide 
a positive friend relationship to children and youth that has suffered a loss or has special needs.  These children reside in Middlesex County and Franklin Township and are in 
desperate need of a positive role model.  Adult Volunteers are being sought to make a difference in the lives of children and youth through one-to-one activities.   Any individual 
18 years old or older, of any ethnic, religious or economic background, who is interested in making a positive impact on a child’s life is eligible to become an adult volunteer men-
tor.   All adult volunteers will be screened, receive training, staff support and other services as needed.   If you are interested in learning more about the Connections Mentoring 
Program, please contact Jeanette Cullen at (732) 738-1323.
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Free Diabetes Conference to Take Place at 
Raritan Bay Area YMCA on Nov. 12

Multi-lingual Event Provides Health Screenings and 
Information to Local Community

Accelerated 
Childbirth 
Education 

Class
PERTH AMBOY… Raritan 
Bay Medical Center, a mem-
ber of the Meridian Health 
family, is holding an Accel-
erated Childbirth Education 
class, Wednesday, July 27, 
6:00 p.m. to 9:30 p.m.  The 
class is designed to help ex-
pectant parents better under-
stand the childbearing pro-
cess and is intended for those 
with limited time. A registered 
nurse with special training in 
labor, delivery and infant care 
facilitates the class.  It will be 
held at the Raritan Bay Area 
YMCA, 357 New Brunswick 
Ave., Lower Level, Perth Am-
boy, NJ.  The fee for the class 
is $75 per couple.  Registration 
required, call 1-800-DOC-
TORS(1-800-362-8677) and 
reference zip code 08861.

Free Container 
Gardening 
Education 

Session
PERTH AMBOY - Integrative 
Health Services at Raritan Bay 
Medical Center, a member of 
the Meridian Health family, 
is providing a free container 
gardening education session 
Wednesday, July 27, 12:00 
p.m. to 1:00 p.m. in the hos-
pital’s Learning Garden at its 
Perth Amboy location.  Learn 
the basics of gardening, in-
cluding container gardening, 
and the importance of healthy 
produce and proper nutrition 
through hands-on and inter-
active education. Children, 
adults, families or summer 
camp groups welcome. Come 
with your garden questions 
and/or photos or samples of 
plants for discussion.  Regis-
tration is required.  Space is 
limited and sessions are held 
weather permitting.  For more 
information and to register, 
call 732.324.5257.

Perth Amboy Wins Statewide 
“Cleanup Award” from the New 

Jersey Clean Communities Council
Press Release 7/19/16
PERTH AMBOY – The City 
of Perth Amboy has received 
the “Urban Cleanup Team 
Award” from the New Jersey 
Clean Communities Council 
(NJCCC).
   On April 23, the City of Perth 
Amboy held “Clean Up Green 
Up Perth Amboy,” a citywide 
cleanup from 9:30 am to 1 
pm. Local residents spent their 
morning cleaning different ar-
eas within Perth Amboy while 
the city supplied the materi-
als and snacks, such as trash 
bags, gloves, water, and light 
refreshments.
    There were also free tree 

saplings for volunteers at the 
end of the event.
    “We can always count on 
Perth Amboy to organize city 
wide cleanups and get people 
excited about helping the en-
vironment,” said NJCCC Ex-
ecutive Director Sandy Huber.  
“We are tremendously proud 
of what they have been able to 
accomplish.”
   NJCCC is  comprehensive,  
statewide  litter-abatement  
program that  has  served  New  
Jersey  residents  and  visi-
tors  for  more  than  25  years.  
Learn more a at njclean.org. 

Cooling Centers Open in Perth Amboy
Heat Wave, High Temperatures

 PERTH AMBOY - The Office of Emergency Management 
has designated cooling centers for the public in three Perth 
Amboy facilities due to high temperatures. 

	 1.) Alexander F. Jankowski Community Center 
	 located on 1 Olive Street;  
	 Open M-F from 9:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. 

 	 2.) Raritan Bay Area YMCA gymnasium located on 
	 357 New Brunswick Avenue;  
	 Open M-F from 5:30 a.m. - 9:45 p.m.

 	 3.)  Perth Amboy Public Library on 
	 196 Jefferson Street; 
	 (Check for Hours) 

   If anyone sees a person who needs help, they are urged to 
call the Perth Amboy Police Department at 732-442-4400. If 
needed, transportation will be provided by local emergency 
responders.
For additional information about the City of Perth Amboy, 
please visit: www.ci.perthamboy.nj.us.

Press Release 7/12/26
BRIDGEWATER/PERTH 
AMBOY – The American Dia-
betes Association will hold its 
8th Annual Conferencia sobre 
la Diabetes (Diabetes Confer-
ence) on Saturday, November 
12, from 10 a.m. to 3 p.m. in 
Perth Amboy, NJ at the Raritan 
Bay Area YMCA, 357 New 
Brunswick Avenue. The con-
ference will offer free health 
and wellness screenings, edu-
cational activities including 
seminars and demonstrations, 
and will stress the importance 
of healthy eating and physical 
fitness to aid in the prevention 
and treatment of diabetes.
   Primary risk factors for type 
2 diabetes are being over-
weight, sedentary, over the 

age of 45 and having a fam-
ily history of diabetes. African 
Americans, Latinos, Native 
Americans, Asian Americans 
and Pacific Islanders are at an 
increased risk.  The confer-
ence will provide resources in 
English, Spanish and Hindi. 
   Nearly 30 million Ameri-
cans have diabetes, including 
12% of adults in New Jersey.  
An estimated 235,000 in the 
state don’t know they have it 
and are at risk for developing 
deadly complications if not 
treated.  
   “Unfortunately, people with 
type 2 diabetes can live for 
years without realizing that 
they have the disease,” said 
Barbara Ortiz, Director of 
Community Health Strategies 

for the Association.  “Many 
times an event like Conferen-
cia is the first step for someone 
to begin a healthier lifestyle.”
   Admission to the conference 
is free and pre-registration 
is encouraged. For more in-
formation or to register visit 
www.diabetes.org/conferen-
cia. If you have questions, 
please call 732-469-7979, Ext. 
3510.
   This year’s conference is 
made possible through the 
generous support of the Hori-
zon Foundation for New Jer-
sey, Novo Nordisk, Merck, 
Janssen, the Devils Care Foun-
dation and the Raritan Bay 
Area YMCA.

www.amboyguardian.com
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RBMC Celebrates Hospital Week, Perth Amboy,
*Photos by Carolyn Maxwell

PERTH AMBOY - Raritan Bay Medical Center celebrated Hospital Week in May with free barbecues, provided by Famous Dave’s, for all team members at Raritan Bay - Perth 
Amboy and Raritan Bay - Old Bridge.  Raritan Bay’s leaders recognized team members for their compassion, skill and commitment to providing high-quality care and services for 
patients during the national observance.

I Want This Project Done!

*Continued From Page 1
   Fernando Gonzalez also 
questioned the market value 
for using the land for storage 
for a year.
   John P. Michalski from the 
law office of DrinkerBiddle 
and Reath came forward to an-
swer questions about this land 
for his client who wants to rent 
it. He responded to the ques-
tion about the market value, 
“There is no market value for 
this land.”
   Fernando emphatically stat-
ed, “I want this project done!”
   Councilman Bill Petrick 
then voiced his concerns, “In 
the past, people had mate-
rial stored on property in the 
City. Sometimes the proposed 
project for the land usage fell 
through and we were left with 
contaminated soil.”
   Michalski responded to Pet-
rick’s concerns about contain-
ments by stating, “The soil 
that is going to be placed on 
this property has been vetted 
by two LSRP’s (Licensed Site 
Remediation Professional Pro-
gram).
   Executive Director Office 
of Economic and Community 
Development Perth Amboy 
Redevelopment Agency Annie 
Hindenlang came forward to 
shed more light on this resolu-
tion. “They are the designated 
developers and we knew that 
this property is heavily con-
taminated. The clean-fill that 
they are bringing in is valuable 
to us. The LSRP’s (State In-
spectors) put their licenses on 

the line when they submit re-
ports about soil. We are hoping 
that they (the Proposed Devel-
opers) will eventually own the 
property. The appraised price 
was assessed at $500,000.”
   Michalski stated, “The insur-
ance on the property is $1.5 
million.”
   This prompted Councilman 
Petrick to say, “We want up 
front money. The City needs 
to benefit today.”
   Fernando Gonzalez said, 
“My concern is they do not do 
this project, but they should 
pay to use the land.”
   Quinones-Perez said, “There 
is no downside to this.”
   Petrick also had a concern 
about the small amount of 
money they were paying per 
month, “If they are serious, 
then let them buy the property 
up front instead of paying $10 
a month for storage.”
   Councilman Fernando Irizar-
ry remarked, “It’s like you are 
trying to negotiate a contract.” 
   Council President Lisa Nan-
ton wanted to know if the in-
surance could be increased on 
the property.
   Hindenlang also informed 
the Council that there are two 
gas lines on this property.
   On Resolution R-329 Coun-
cilman Fernando Gonzalez 
made a motion to table the 
resolution. Council President 
Lisa Nanton seconded the mo-
tion. Councilman Irizarry and 
Petrick voted, “no.” Pabon, 
Nanton and Gonzalez voted 
“yes.” Motion to table passed.

Send Your Events to: AmboyGuardian@gmail.com
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Have You Volunteered Lately?
PERTH AMBOY - The first and biggest benefit AmeriCorps VISTA members get is the satisfaction 
of incorporating service into their lives and making a difference in their community and country. 
The intangible benefits alone, such as pride, satisfaction and accomplishment are worthwhile rea-
sons to serve.  There are other benefits as well including awards, job and education certifications, 
professional development, and more. For more info call the Jewish Renaissance Medical Center, 
275 Hobart Street, Perth Amboy.

WWW.AMBOYGUARDIAN.COM
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Photo Release 7/15/16
PERTH AMBOY - A meeting 
with a hospital president, dis-
cussions about operating room 
care with nurses, and anesthe-
sia and surgical training pro-
vided by an anesthesiologist 
and surgeon; quite a day for 
a group of 8th grade students 
from Primoris Academy who 
visited Raritan Bay Medical 
Center in Perth Amboy recent-
ly.
   When Andrew Markov, who 
attends the Westwood, N.J. 
school, expressed interest in 
his father Dr. Nikolai Y. Mar-
kov’s career, the board certi-
fied general surgeon arranged 
for a class trip with hospital ad-
ministration.  The students met 
with Raritan Bay President Mi-
chael R. D’Agnes where they 
had a chance to discuss hospi-
tal operations before heading 
to the surgical unit, donning 
scrubs and getting some hand-
on education.
Nurse Manager of the OR Jea-
nette Cowen, R.N.; Bridget 
Laudien, R.N.; Victoria Men-
dez, CST; Marta Wojcik, R.N.; 

In the back row, from left, is Bridget Laudien, R.N.; Nikolai Markov, 
D.O.; Victoria Mendez, CST, and Marta Wojcik, R.N.

Director of the Division of 
Anesthesiology Andrew Cit-
ron, M.D., and Dr. Markov 
demonstrated how various sur-
gical equipment is used, simu-
lated laparoscopic surgery and 
discussed anesthesia, airway 
management, creating a sterile 
environment and more. “The 
need for a surgeon to have in-
novative and creative skills 
inspire me to want to be a sur-
geon,” said Andrew. Fellow 
student Tyler Romeo said, “I 
loved the mix between the en-
trepreneurial advice from the 
president and the experiences 
provided by the surgical team!”
“We are very appreciative of 
Raritan Bay for providing our 
students this unforgettable ex-
perience,” said Primoris Acad-
emy Executive Director Katie 
Kim. “They could not stop 
talking about the time they had 
all the way back, and we’ve 
received a lot of positive feed-
back from parents.”  The acad-
emy is a private elementary, 
middle and high school with 
a curriculum designed for ad-
vanced learners.

Dr. Markov demonstrates how to ‘prep and drape’ a surgical patient.

8th Grade Class Scrubs 
In for Surgery at 

Raritan Bay Medical Center

Dr. Markov shows the students how the laparoscopic camera is used, 
including Andrew Markov, to his immediate left.

At the Sports Classic is, from left; Andrew Citron, M.D., director of 
the Division of Anesthesiology at Raritan Bay; Raritan Bay Medi-
cal Center Foundation Board Member Walter Brasch; Michael R. 
D’Agnes; Thomas McAuliffe; Timothy P. O’Brien, chairman of 
Raritan Bay Medical Center Foundation Board of Directors; Joseph 
Britton; Kenneth G. Swan, M.D., and Meridian Health President 
and Chief Executive Officer John K. Lloyd, FACHE.

*Photo Submitted by Eric Muench

Raritan Bay Medical Center Foundation 
Sports Classic Raises More Than $113,000

Press Release 7/15/16
Old Bridge – Raritan Bay 
Medical Center Foundation 
raised more than $113,000 
during its 2016 Sports Classic 
held recently at Deal Golf & 
Country Club in Deal. Led by 
event co-chairs, Walter Brasch 
and Joe Britton, this year’s 
Sports Classic saw 116 golf-
ers compete in the golf tour-
nament and raise money for 
advanced surgical equipment 
at Raritan Bay Medical Center.
   “The funds generated through 
the Sports Classic are going 
to make a huge impact on the 
way surgery is performed at 
Raritan Bay Medical Center,” 
said Michael R. D’Agnes, 
FACHE, president of Raritan 
Bay Medical Center. “With 
this laparoscopic equipment, 
our physicians can perform 
minimally invasive surgery, 
which provides a number of 
advantages to patients includ-
ing reduced pain and shorter 
recovery times.”
   During the reception, grate-
ful patient Thomas McAuliffe, 
of Woodbridge, NJ, and his 
physician, Kenneth G. Swan, 
Jr., M.D., director of the Di-
vision of Orthopedic Surgery 
and medical director of the 
Human Motion Institute at 

Raritan Bay, shared a heartfelt 
testimony to the care provided 
at the hospital. In addition, the 
laparoscopic equipment be-
ing purchased with the funds 
raised from the outing was on 
display for guests to explore 
and learn more about how this 
innovative tool will enhance 
Raritan Bay’s surgical servic-
es.  
   The Sports Classic commit-
tee is grateful for the generous 
support of leadership sponsors 
this year, which include Event 
Sponsor; Atrium Post - Acute 

Center of Matawan, Cocktail 
Hour & Dinner Sponsors; In-
vestors Bank - Woodbridge 
Office and Med-Metrix and 
Halfway House Sponsors; 
Prudential, Raritan Bay Medi-
cal Center’s Medical Staff and 
University Radiology.
   For additional information 
about the Raritan Bay Medical 
Center Foundation or to make 
a donation, please contact Ex-
ecutive Director, Linda M. 
Hill, PharmD at 732-324-5374 
or by e-mail at foundation@
rbmc.org.

School Busses & Vehicles Parked in 
Perth Amboy Train Station 7/24/16

*Photos by Paul W. Wang

Beach Trip
PERTH AMBOY – Point Pleas-
ant Beach Trip, Saturday, Au-
gust 13, 2016 from 8:15 a.m. to 
5:00 p.m. Cost: $20 Adults; $15 
Children under 11 yrs. Includes 
Beach Pass, Aquarium Tour & 
Miniature Golf. Money Order 
Only. Transportation Included. 
Children must be accompanied 
by a parent or guardian at all 
times. For more information, 
call the Office of Recreation 
732-826-1690 ext. 4305.

Dorney Park 
Trip

PERTH AMBOY -  Trip to Dor-
ney Park & Wildwater King-
dom, Friday August 19, 2016 
from 8 a.m. to 6 p.m. $35pp. 
Money Order Only. Transpor-
tation Included. Children must 
be accompanied by a parent or 
guardian at all times. For more 
information, call the Office of 
Recreation 732-826-1690 ext. 
4305.

NY Yankees 
Trip

PERTH AMBOY – Trip to NY 
Yankees vs. Baltimore Ori-
oles, Friday, August 26, 2016. 
Game starts 7:05 p.m. $55pp. 
Money Order Only. Transpor-
tation Included. Children must 
be accompanied by a parent or 
guardian at all times. For more 
information, call the Office of 
Recreation 732-826-1690 ext. 
4305.
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This Week in World War II 
75 Years Ago

By: Phil Kohn. Dedicated to the memory of his father, GM3 
Walter Kohn, U.S. Navy Armed Guard, USNR, and all men 
and women who have answered the country’s call in time of 
need. Phil can be contacted at ww2remembered@yahoo.com.
   During the night of July 25, 1941, Italian “explosive boats” 
and “human torpedoes” attempt to attack shipping in the 
Grand Harbour, at Valletta, Malta. German forces capture 
Tallinn, Estonia.
   On July 26, President Roosevelt, in retaliation for intended 
Japanese moves into Indochina, orders all Japanese assets in 
the U.S. seized. Prime Minister Churchill does the same in 
the United Kingdom. The value involved is around $134 mil-
lion, but Japanese oil imports are curtailed by almost 80%. 
Roosevelt also orders the nationalization of the 150,000-man 
Philippines Army “for the duration of the current national 
emergency” (the Philippines being a U.S. Commonwealth), 
and appoints U.S. Army Gen. Douglas MacArthur command-
er of all U.S. forces in the Philippines.
   A German pincer movement on July 27 cuts off Soviet forc-
es around Smolensk, Russia, located on the Dnieper River 
around 220 miles west-southwest of Moscow. Over 100,000 
prisoners are taken. After a weeklong siege, the Germans 
capture Mogilev, Belorussia, about 48 miles west of the Rus-
sian border.
    The Japanese army on July 28 begins occupying bases in 
southern Indochina, the location of which could be used as 
launch points for invasions of Malaya, the East Indies or the 
Philippines. Officials in the Dutch East Indies freeze all Japa-
nese assets there, and cancel all Dutch-Japanese oil deals. In 
Europe, Finland and Great Britain break off diplomatic rela-
tions. German forces take Kingisepp, Russia, some 86 miles 
southwest of Leningrad.
   On July 29, the governments of Vichy France and Japan 
sign a protocol concerning joint defense and military coop-
eration. The pact gives Japan the right to eight airbases in 
Indochina and permits a greater troop presence in the country. 
In Tokyo, Japan freezes all Dutch assets in the country. At this 
point, about 75% of Japan’s foreign trade is at a standstill, 
and almost 90% of its oil imports are cut off.
   The American gunboat USS Tutuila, stationed at the Na-
tionalist Chinese capital of Chungking (now Chongqing), 
on July 30 is severely damaged by bombs from a Japanese 
air raid. The government of Japan apologizes to the U.S. for 
the incident. At Glina, in the Independent State of Croatia (a 
Nazi puppet state), members of the Ustaše — the Croatian 
fascist militia — begin a four-day massacre of between 700 
and 1,200 Serbian peasants. In Indochina, some 13,000 Japa-
nese troops occupy Saigon. In Ukraine, the German 6th Army 
makes its first direct attack on Kiev.
    Reichsmarschall Hermann Göring, under instructions from 
Adolf Hitler, on July 31 orders SS Gen. Reinhard Heydrich to 
“submit to me as soon as possible a general plan of the admin-
istrative material and financial measures necessary for carry-
ing out the desired Final Solution of the Jewish question.” In 
North Africa, Axis forces are reorganized. Maj. Gen. Ludwig 
Crüwell is given command of the German Afrika Korps, re-
porting to Lt. Gen. Erwin Rommel, now in charge of the new 
Panzer Group Africa (Panzergruppe Afrika). The German 5th 
Light Division is redesignated the 21st Panzer Division, giv-
ing Rommel two panzer divisions and one German infantry 
division in his force. On the Eastern Front, German advances 
continue unabated. In Washington, the U.S. recognizes the 
Czechoslovak government-in-exile.

2016 Historic Perth Amboy 
Calendars

2016 Historic Perth Amboy Calendars are available at the 
Barge Restaurant, 201 Front St., Perth Amboy 732-442-3000 
or at Fertigs Uniform Store, 195 New Brunswick Ave., Perth 
Amboy 732-442-1079 or Call Paul or Katherine at 732-293-
1090. Back by popular demand the Calendars feature old 
photographs from Perth Amboy. Sponsored by the Kearny 
Cottage Historical Association and the Friends of Perth Am-
boy Free Public Library. Calendars are $10 Each.

Have a Special Pet?
Email us your Pet Photos to AmboyGuardian@
gmail.com with Pet of the Week in the Subject 
line and explain why your pet is special. Please 
include Name and Phone# for verification.

Pet of the Week

This Chihuahua’s name is Cujo, Cujo is a sweet little fella with a 
bit of a temper at times but he has a big heart that makes him very 
special. Cujo is also special because he was a gift from my mom 
who rescued him from Puerto Rico so I can give him a forever 
happy home. Angelica

Frog Hollow 
Annual 5K Run 
& Health Walk 

Postponed
Press Release 6/3/16
SOUTH AMBOY - Due to 
unfortunate circumstances the 
Frog Hollow 5K Run & Health 
Walk has been rescheduled to 
Sunday, September 11, 2016.
The Frog Hollow Swim and 
Tennis Club is located on Fer-
ris St. off of South Pine Ave. 
in South Amboy, NJ.  For ad-
ditional information call race 
director, Danny McCrone at 
732-721-6592 or go to www.
froghollowswim.com

Send Your Events to: 
AmboyGuardian@gmail.com

Book Drop/
Book Sale

PERTH AMBOY - The Friends 
of the Perth Amboy Free Pub-
lic Library have established a 
use for the books you have read 
and would like to recycle!!!  
Drop off your books . . . pick 
up a book or two ($.50 for pa-
perbacks/$1 for hard cover) …
or select a “bag of books” for a 
price of only $5.  Please no text 
books or reference books.  
   Visit us at the Brighton Ave. 
Community Center located at 
the corner of Brighton Ave. 
and Sadowski Pkwy. in Perth 
Amboy.  The schedule for the 
next three months is as fol-
lows:  Saturdays, August 13th 
(CLOSED!) August 27th, Sep-
tember 10th, September 24th, 
October 8th, October 22nd, No-
vember 12th, December 10th. 
We will be there from 1:00 
p.m.- 3:00 p.m.  (weather per-
mitting). For more info, e-mail 
us at friendsofperthamboyli-
brary@gmail.com 

Do you or someone you know have 
Old Photographs or Documents?
 The Kearny Cottage Historical Society is
Looking for Old Photos and Documents of 

Perth Amboy, South Amboy, 
Woodbridge, Fords, etc. (Local Area)

For an Archiving Project - Your Photos & Documents 
will be scanned into digital format & returned to you.

For more info please call 732-293-1090

AC Bus Trip
Hungarian 

Reformed Church
PERTH AMBOY - Atlantic 
City Bus Trip to Resorts Ca-
sino on Sunday, August 7, 
2016 Sponsored by the Fel-
lowship Circle of the Hungar-
ian Reformed Church, 331 
Kirkland Place Perth Amboy. 
Bus leaves the church at 12:00 
noon for a 6 hour stay at the 
Casino from when we arrive 
in AC. Cost: $27 per person. 
You will receive $25 in slot 
play. Bagged lunch provided
To reserve a seat call:  732-
261-8726. Payment due 
ASAP.

A.C. Bus Trip
San Salvador 

Seniors
PERTH AMBOY - The San 
Salvador Seniors are sponsor-
ing a bus trip to Caesar’s Casi-
no in AC on Thursday, August 
4th. Bus leaves 12 Noon from 
the Perth Amboy Knights of 
Columbus, High Street, Perth 
Amboy. Cost 30 pp. Receive 
$30 back in slot dollars. For 
more info call Joe at 732-826-
0819. 

Raritan Bay 
Cruisers 

Car Show
WOODBRIDGE- Tuesdays 
from May 10th - Sept. 27th 
from 6 p.m. - 9 p.m. at Pizza 
Hut, Rte. 9, Woodbridge (Wal-
Mart Parking Lot) Weather 
Permitting. Trophy’s Awarded 
+ 1 Cancer Trophy Award. For 
More info: Call 732-585-7365

Ask the Rabbi
EDISON - “Ask the Rabbi” 
with Rabbi Saks from Congre-
gation Beth Mordecai of Perth 
Amboy, in the Menlo Park Mall 
food court, every Wednesday 
from 12:00 Noon - 1:30 p.m. 
All questions will be answered. 
Everyone is invited to ask.

A.C. Bus Trip
Holy Rosary 

Seniors
HOPELAWN - Holy Rosary 
Seniors Bus Trip to Golden 
Nugget, A/C on Tuesday, Au-
gust 16, 2016, Cost: $30 - $25 
back in play and $5 food. Bus 
leaves church parking lot 625 
Florida Grove Rd, Hopelawn 
at 10:00 a.m. and arrives back 
approx. 7:00 p.m. Any Ques-
tions, etc. Please contact Ron-
nie Dematteo: 732-442-5252
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LOOKING BACK

Senior Scene
Happenings

Perth Amboy
WED. Jul. 27	 Holy Rosary Seniors, 12:30 p.m., Auditorium, 	
		      Florida Grove Rd.
	 •	 St. Stephen’s Seniors, 1 p.m., Cafeteria, State St.
THURS. Jul. 26	 The Cathedral International Seniors, 9:30 a.m., 
		     Family Life Center, Madison Ave.
MON. Aug. 1	 St. James Golden Girls, 10 a.m., 
		       Fellowship Hall, Commerce St.
TUES. Aug. 2	 Holy Spirit Seniors, 12:30 p.m.,
 		      Church Hall, Brace Ave.
	 •	 Market Square Seniors, 1 p.m., 
		     Presbyterian Center, Market St.
WED. Aug. 3	 Holy Rosary Seniors, 12:30 p.m., Auditorium, 	
		      Florida Grove Rd.
	 •	 St. Stephen’s Seniors, 1 p.m., Cafeteria, State St.
	 •	 Holy Trinity Seniors, 1 p.m., 
		        Church Hall, Lawrie & Johnstone St.
	 •	 Holy Trinity Seniors, 1 p.m., 
		        Church Hall, Lawrie & Johnstone St.
THURS. Aug. 4	 The Cathedral International Seniors, 9:30 a.m., 
		     Family Life Center, Madison Ave.
South Amboy
WED. Aug. 3	  St. Mary’s Seniors, 12 Noon, 
		     Senior Center, S. Stevens Ave.
MON. Aug. 8	  South Amboy Seniors, 12 Noon, 
		      Senior Center, S. Stevens Ave.
MON. Aug. 22  	  Sacred Heart Seniors, 12 Noon
                                Memorial Hall, Wash Ave.

Attn: If Your Club changes its 
Schedule due to the Holidays or if you have 

Community Events to Submit
Please give us two weeks advanced notice!

732-896-4446 or 732-261-2610
AmboyGuardian@gmail.com

Answers
From Puzzle
On Page 15

Novena to St. Rita

O holy protectress of those 
who art in greatest need, 
thou who shineth as a star 
of hope in the midst of dark-
ness, blessed Saint Rita, bright 
mirror of God’s grace, in pa-
tience and fortitude thou art a 
model of all the states in life. 
I unite my will with the will 
of God through the merits of 
my Savior Jesus Christ, and 
in particular through his pa-
tient wearing of the crown of 
thorns, which with tender de-
votion thou didst daily con-
template. Through the merits 
of the holy Virgin Mary and 
thine own graces and virtues, 
I ask thee to obtain my earnest 
petition, provided it be for the 
greater glory of God and my 
own sanctification. Guide and 
purify my intention, O holy 
protectress and advocate, so 
that I may obtain the pardon 
of all my sins and the grace to 
persevere daily, as thou didst 
in walking with courage, gen-
erosity, and fidelity down the 
path of life. (Mention your 
request.) Saint Rita, advocate 
of the impossible, pray for 
us. Saint Rita, advocate of the 
helpless, pray for us. 
Recite the Our Father, Hail 
Mary, and Glory Be three 
times each. K.M. & C.M.

Stories From Perth Amboy
PERTH AMBOY - Stories From Perth Amboy by Katherine 
Massopust is available at the Barge Restaurant, 201 Front 
St., Perth Amboy or in Fertig’s Uniform Store, 195 New 
Brunswick Ave., Perth Amboy For more info call Katherine 
at 732-261-2610 or call the Barge at 732-442-3000 -  or Fer-
tig’s at 732-442-1079 -  A Great Gift! Get it now along with 
Then & Now: Perth Amboy!

PERTH AMBOY - Tennis Courts circa 1930’s.
                                                           *Photo Courtesy of the Kearny Cottage Historical Association
This Photo was restored under a grant for the Kearny Cottage Archiving project by the Middlesex 
Cultural and Heritage Commission

3D Printer 
News

SOUTH AMBOY - Every 
Thursday from 6 p.m. -7:30 
p.m. at the Dowdell Library, 
100 Harold G. Hoffman Pla-
za, South Amboy, adjacent to 
South Amboy Middle High 
School. Stop in and watch 
our 3D Printer In action! New 
design every week! For more 
info call 732-721-6060 or 
email comments@dowdell.
org or go to www.dowdell.org

Remember  to 
Say Your 
Novenas!

Drums Alive 
Fitness Class

SOUTH AMBOY - The 
Knights of Columbus in South 
Amboy will be running anoth-
er session of Drums Alive Fit-
ness class starting on Thursday, 
August 4th. The class starts at 
7 p.m. and ends at 7:50 p.m. 
The cost is $65 for 8 classes.  
Part of the proceeds benefit the 
Columbian Club Council No. 
426. Location is 308 Fourth 
Street, South Amboy. Equip-
ment needed is a Stability Ball 
and a Yoga mat, the rest of the 
equipment is provided.
   This class is therapeutic and 
also a serious cardio workout! 
Drumming has been proven to 
trigger the release of endor-
phins. Endorphins help us en-
dure pain and stress and make 
us more joyful. It has been 
proven that when people drum 
in a group even more endor-
phins are released!
    Pre-registration is required. 
Please call Denise at 732-525-
9536 or email healthandfit-
nesswithdenise@gmail.com. 
Please note that Tabata and 
Yoga classes on Tuesday eve-
nings are still underway, join 
us at any time.

Vacation 
Bible School

PERTH AMBOY – Classes for 
3yrs – 5yrs (pre-school); 6yrs 
– 9yrs (elementary); 10yrs 
– 12yrs (pre-teen); 13yrs – 
18yrs (teen). Date: Monday, 
July 25, 2016 to Thursday July 
28, 2016 from 9 a.m. to 3 p.m. 
Venue: RCCG-SOP, 489 Am-
boy Ave., Perth Amboy. Pack-
age Includes a breakfast and 
lunch, games and many more. 
Registration is FREE. T-Shirt 
$10. To register visit www.
rccgsopni.org/vbs  or call 732-
293-0020 or 732-762-5470.Food Stamps 

Assistance
PERTH AMBOY - Every 
Wednesday there will be a 
Food Stamps Assistance Pro-
gram 10 a.m.- 5 p.m.:  JRF’s 
Family Success Center fami-
lies to come in and meet with 
a representative from the 
Community Food Bank of NJ 
to assist with food stamps ap-
plication and eligibility guide-
lines. For additional informa-
tion please call 732-638-5063 
or visit our office located at: 
149 Kearny Ave. Perth Amboy 
(Rear of Proprietary House).
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Check out Our Website for 
Breaking News!

www.amboyguardian.com

20” Mower Rear Bag-
ger $60 - No Bag - $50 
- 732-727-5056

Beer TAP knobs, Bal-
lantine & others, Col-
lectibles 10 different 
$30 - 732-727-8417

Medical Assistant Latest 
Edition 2014 Workbook 
w/software & hard cover, 
both $40 or B.O. Like 
New 732-734-7452

Dremel 16” Scroll Saw, 
2 Speed, Model #1671 
with Table - used 2x, 
$75 firm. 732-826-8024

Thatcher for Snapper 
Power Lawn Mower 
Good Condition $20 732-
826-8522

10 Piano Keyboards 
$50 each, piano stands 
$20 each. 732-881-0434

Black Odona Dining  
Table, 4 Chairs, Black 
Matching Hutch $50 
732-882-5516

Excellent Condition Fu-
ton Brown with Storage 
underneath $75 or B.O. 
732-895-4542

Hunter Hepatech Air Puri-
fier Rooms up to 17’x19’ 
$70 - 917-952-3041

Exercise - Tony Little 
Gazelle - $50; Air Condi-
tioner - $50 732-442-1953

Canning Jars - Pints & 
Quarts $4 Doz. Please 
Bring own boxes - 732-
442-8732

Solid Oak Coffee Table 
$75; Oak End Table $50 
732-570-9732

Back2Life Therapeutic 
Massager for home or 
office use. Great Condi-
tion $50 - 732-595-6334

Adult Medical Walking 
Crutches - $75 Firm. 
732-599-1514

2 Tires 195-75-14 Ex-
cellent Cond. $20 Each;  
$30 for Both - 732-634-
3815

A.C. 10,000 BTU $50 
Safetywork - Rain Jack-
et Med/Liner, Hood $35 
732-654-5797

2 Tents Ab Aerodome $40 
each, Steiff Bear $70, Dolls 
- Mickey/Minnie, Shirley 
Temple, Babe Ruth, Box-
ing Champs $10 Each 732-
713-0536

A/C Frigidaire 5000 BTU’s 
- Small, Lite, Mint Condi-
tion  $60 732-721-4477

Patio Set - table um-
brella, 4 chairs $50, 
exercise bike $25 - 732-
721-7186

Tell Our Advertisers
YOU SAW IT IN

If you wish to publish a Novena in The Amboy Guardian, 
you may use this coupon.

Send check or money order (no cash), include your name and
telephone, to: THE AMBOY GUARDIAN,
P.O. Box 127 • PERTH AMBOY • NJ 08862

How to Publish a Novena

A Petition to 
St. Joseph

A Petition to 
St. Jude

Cost $10. 
Pre-payment required.

Name ______________________

Address ____________________

Phone_(____)________________

Initials at end of prayer_________

Please circle one prayer, and return 
form with check or money order to:

The Amboy Guardian
P.O. Box 127

Perth Amboy, NJ 08862

Dear St. Joseph, head of the 
most perfect household, foster 
father of Jesus and guardian 
of His mother Mary, I confi-
dently place myself and all my 
concerns under your care and 
protection. I ask that, through 
your powerful intercession 
with God, you obtain for me all 
the help and graces that I need 
for my spiritual and temporal 
welfare and in particular, the 
special favor I now ask there 
mention or think of your home 
sale or any other petition, es-
pecially family needs. Good 
St. Joseph, I know with confi-
dence, that your prayers on my 
behalf will be heard by God 
and that He will grant my re-
quest, if it be for His glory and 
my greater good. Thank you St. 
Joseph, for having responded to 
my call.  Amen.          G.T.A.

May the sacred Heart of 
Jesus be adored, glori-
fied, loved and preserved 
throughout the world, now 
and forever. Sacred Heart 
of Jesus, have mercy on us. 
St. Jude, worker of Miracles, 
pray for us. St. Jude, helper 
of the hopeless, pray for us.
Say this prayer nine times a 
day for nine days. It has nev-
er been known to fail. Pub-
lication must be promised.          

        Thank you, St. Jude
                                                 F.M.J.

Prayer To St. Clare

Prayer To Blessed Mother

Prayer To Blessed Virgin

St. Jude Novena

For Employment

Prayer To Holy Spirit

Thanksgiving Novena

Pray The Rosary

Prayer To St. Jude

Novena To St. Anthony

Novena To St. Joseph

OTHER ___________

To Place Your Classified:
First 10 Words .... $6.50

5 Weeks for .... $30
Each additional word over 10 words 30¢

Tel:

Classifieds

Hoover Carpet Cleaner 
Machine - Five Scrub-
bing Brushes - Like 
New $50 732-236-4479

Lounge Chairs - Four - 
2 Adult, 2 Child, Vinyl, 
$20 732-283-0975

Sewing Machine - 
Heavy Duty, Kenmore 
Mint Condition $40 or 
Best Offer - 732-290-
1551

34 OF Kitchen Cabinet 
Door Knobs $25 - Gold 
Rustic 732-324-2791

Exercise Machine Ad-
justable Tension, Origi-
nally $450 - Like New 
$45 - 732-325-5293

Nuwave Oven $50 - 
732-354-1249

Speakers Cerwin-Vega 
MX250 Watts - 250 Max, 
Sensitivix 107db $75 Call 
Jerry - 732-425-1394

Metal Twin Loftbed Frame 
$50 - Gym Exercise Step 
Machine $25 732-442-1093

For SaleFor Sale

SERVICE DIRECTORY
Call Carolyn @ 732-896-4446

For Sale

Caregiver
Care of Loved Ones. 
24/7 Medicine, Dr. App. 
Clean, Cook, Shop, 24/6 
or 7 Days. 908-494-8967  
- Live in 7/20

   New Plans for the Service Direc-
tory Effective 1/1/16 Are Now in 
Effect. If You Offer a Service, the 
Place to Advertise is Here! Cater-
ing, Auto Repair, Heating, Plumb-
ing, Home Health Aides,  Landscap-
ing, Snow Removal, Dry Cleaning, 
Chauffeuring, Exterminators, Hall 
Rentals, Insurance, Delivering Ser-
vices, Hair Stylists, Photography, 
Counseling, WebSite Design, Com-
puter Repair etc.
   Call For the Plan Which Will Best 
Suit Your Needs. Discounted Rates 
for Prepaid Plans! 

732-896-4446

Please Notify Us Immediately After Your Item is Sold!
Email: AmboyGuardian@gmail.com

Ads Sell!
Call Carolyn
732-896-4446

Items For Sale
Dinette - 6 Chairs $100 - 
908-840-4575  7/27



July 27, 2016 * The Amboy Guardian  .15

Photos by the Bay/
ALR Photography
All your Photography Needs 

Under One Roof
Portraits/Weddings/Sweet Sixteens

Bar/Bat Mitzvah’s/Head Shots
Photo Restoration

www.photosbythebay.com
732-500-5093 or 732-293-1090

Photography Done Right!

Need an 
Advertisement 

Designed? 
Call 732-293-1090
www.photosbythebay.com

Graphic Design

Your Ad Can 
Go Here for 

$11 
a week

10 Week 
Minimum
Required

Your Ad Here

The Amboy Guardian 
Classified’s Work!

Classified Ads
Send to P.O. Box 127, Perth Amboy, NJ 08862 

SERVICE DIRECTORY
Call Carolyn @ 732-896-4446

Use this space for 10 words or less to sell your small house-
hold items that are too inexpensive to advertise. The Am-
boy Guardian will print your classified and help you sell 
those items.  Merchandise must be used and not new items 
for sale items.  Please send one ad per family per week.

FREE CLASSIFIED AD 
FOR ITEMS $75 & UNDER

Tel:

Send to: The Amboy Guardian, P.O. Box 127, Perth Amboy, NJ 08862

Your Ad Can 
Go Here for 

$11 
a week

10 Week 
Minimum
Required

Your Ad Here

Your Ad Can Go Here for 

$19 
a week

10 Week Minimum Required
Call 732-896-4446

Your Ad Here

Photography

Ancient Order 
of Hibernians

271 Second St., South Amboy, NJ
Hall Accommodates 100 Guests
Great for: Birthdays, Retirement, 

Christenings, Communion Parties and 
Baby or Wedding Showers

VERY REASONABLE RATES
Call: 732-721-2098

Hall for Rent

Website & Graphic Design

Your Ad Can 
Go Here for 

$11 
a week

10 Week 
Minimum
Required

Your Ad Here

Make Dull 
Stuff Sharp
 Cheap!!!

Knives, Scissors, 
Garden Tools

732-442-3430

Sharpening

Your Ad Can Go Here for 

$19 
a week

10 Week Minimum Required
Call 732-896-4446

Your Ad Here

Hall For Rent

Your Ad Can Go Here for 

$19 
a week

10 Week Minimum Required
Call 732-896-4446

Your Ad Here
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Want to Sell Your 
Home Quickly?

Call 
Petra Best Realty!

Enrique Hernandez
Broker/Owner CRB, SFR, CRS

329 SMITH STREET • PERTH AMBOY
(732) 442-1400 • (732) 442-1480 fax

FOR MORE OF OUR FEATURED LISTINGS, PLEASE GO TO OUR WEBSITE:
WWW.PETRABESTREALTY.COM

Dedication, Vision and Results!
The Real Estate Team With

PETRA BEST REALTY WILL GET YOUR HOUSE SOLD FAST!!!
PLEASE CALL FOR FREE MARKET ANALYSIS!

FORDS - large two family moving condition great loca-
tion 3 Bedroom each apartment great layout, corner prop-
erty and much more. Sold “AS IS.” $389,000

PERTH AMBOY - Big house, separate dining and living 
room. Close to everything including the beautiful water 
front. Very good size attic for storage. Needs some re-
pairs. All bedroom with closets. Home being sold “as is”. 
Buyer resp. for C/O and all inspections. $169,000

PERTH AMBOY - PROPERTY IS MOVE IN CON-
DITION. PROPERTY SOLD “AS IS” CONDITION. 
BUYER RESP. FOR SMOKE CERT., C/O AND ANY 
REPAIRS. $159,900

PERTH AMBOY - THIS IS THE OPPORTUNITY TO 
BECOME YOUR OWN BOSS. GREAT POTENCIAL 
INCOME LOCATED IN DOWNTOWN BUSINESS 
AREA. ALL EQUIPMENT INCLUDED IN SALE. 
CENTRAL AIR, USE OF BASEMENT AND LOT 
MORE. LEASE END ON FEBRUARY 2016. RENEW-
ABLE EVERY 3 YRS WITH 5% INCREASE. $120,000

FORDS - Beautiful Ranch 2 bedroom contemporary styl-
ish with many upgrades including kitchen cabinets. it is 
being sold in “AS IS” condition. Buyer is responsible for 
Smoker cert and all repairs. $185,000

PERTH AMBOY - Superb custom built all Brick Ranch 
3 bedroom, New windows & newer roof, single owner 
that took good care over the years, all hardwood floors, 
large basement, garage. built in 1967 a “must see” and 
much more. You will love this home’s location. $264,800

PERTH AMBOY - Buyer is resp. for variance and per-
mits $55,000

PERTH AMBOY - Grocery Store Vacant Owner pays 
heat and water 5K annually. Buyer is responsible for 
C/O, all repairs and 10K federal lien. $175,000

PERTH AMBOY - Great fixer-upper with lots of poten-
tial, 3 bedroom, formal dining room, close to all major 
highways and public transportation. buyer is responsible 
for C/O. Termite Cert and all repairs. $145,000


